Reference
Number:
From:
Date:

Subject:

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
FOIAH2425/595
Private Individual
23 January 2025

Clinical Systems contract details

Please provide information regarding the following 8 system contracts and their accompanying
consulting support contracts:

Please enter 'No System Installed' or ‘No Department’ under supplier name if your trust does not
use the system or have the department:

Q1 Analytics (PLICS)
a) System type —
b) Supplier name —
c) System name —
d) Date installed —
e) Contract expiration —
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework —
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):
[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No

m)

If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —

n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —

o) Consulting contract start date —

p) Consulting contract end date —

=
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PLICS

IQVIA

Provision of Patient Level Information Costing Software
September 2024
19/09/2027

No

No

CCS

None
£64,500.00
None

No

. No applicable, as per A1l above

No applicable, as per A1l above
No applicable, as per A1l above
No applicable, as per A1l above



Q2

A2

Q3

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Critical care

a) System type —

b) Supplier name —

c) System name —

d) Date installed —

e) Contract expiration —

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No

h) Procurement framework —

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):

[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No

m) If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —

n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —

o) Consulting contract start date —

p) Consulting contract end date —

EPR (Electronic Patient Record)
System C
BadgerNet
Go-Live March 2013
31/03/2026
Yes (3-year term)
No
LPP
Interfaces with Meditech, BD Alaris, Philips
£245,113.20
None
No

. No applicable, as per A2l above
No applicable, as per A2l above
No applicable, as per A2l above
No applicable, as per A2l above
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Cardiology

a) System type —

b) Supplier name —

c) System name —

d) Date installed —

e) Contract expiration —

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework —

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):



A3

Q4

Ad

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No
m) If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —
n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —
o) Consulting contract start date —
p) Consulting contract end date —

Electronic Patient Record System
Philips
Intelispace ISCV
01/10/2020
30/09/2025
No
No
NHS Supply Chain
Meditech Expanse
£346,558.38
None
No

. No applicable, as per A3l above
No applicable, as per A3l above
No applicable, as per A3l above
No applicable, as per A3l above
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Diagnostic imaging

a) System type —

b) Supplier name —

c) System name —

d) Date installed —

e) Contract expiration —

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No

h) Procurement framework —

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):

[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No

m) If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —

n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —

o) Consulting contract start date —

p) Consulting contract end date —

Clinical Radiology Information System (CRIS)
Magentus

CRIS

June 2022

June 2032

No

No
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Alder Hey Children's [\Y/153

NHS Foundation Trust
h. QE Facilities
I. Meditech Electronic Patient Record
j- £322,000
k. None
I. No
m. No applicable, as per A4l above
n. No applicable, as per A4l above
o. No applicable, as per A4l above
p. No applicable, as per A4l above

) Diagnostic imaging
) Philips

) PACS

) 01/07/2023

) 30/06/2033

) No

g) No
h) QE Facilities

i) IEP, meditech, CRIS, other modalities eg X ray, CT, MR, US etc. also integrated with
ENT endoscopy equipment, theatre video recording, medical photography, ECHO, GAIT
lab, Bonexpert, osirix, ISP

j) £1,247,071.00

k) None

) No

m) N/A

n) N/A
o) N/A
p) N/A

a
b
c
d
e
f

Q5 EPR
a) System type —
b) Supplier name —
c) System name —
d) Date installed —
e) Contract expiration —
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework —
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):
[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No
m) If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —
n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —
o) Consulting contract start date —
p) Consulting contract end date —

A5 a. EPR (Electronic Patient Record)
b. Meditech UK
c. Meditech



Q6

>
o

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
July 2015
23/08/2025
No
No
HealthTrust Europe framework is used.
Detect - Nursing Observations
ImageNow - Scanned Document View
GE Electric Anaesthetic Record
Medisec - Clinical Letters and Digital Dictation
eConsent - Electronic consent forms
Carestream PACS Medical Imaging Radiology, Cardiology ISCV
BadgetNet
£687,617.92.
None
No
. No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
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Vendor Neutral Archive

a) System type —

b) Supplier name —

c) System name —

d) Date installed —

e) Contract expiration —

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No

h) Procurement framework —

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):

[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No

m) If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —

n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —

o) Consulting contract start date —

p) Consulting contract end date —

PACS (Picture archiving and communication system)
Phillips

PACS

2013

June 2032

No

No

QE Facilities

Meditech Electronic Patient Record System
£1.2M

None

No
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Q7

A7

Q8

A8

Alder Hey Children's [\Y/153

NHS Foundation Trust
. No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above

T OS5 3

Video Consulting

a) System type —

b) Supplier name —

c) System name —

d) Date installed —

e) Contract expiration —

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No

h) Procurement framework —

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) — Accompanying Consulting Support
Contracts (if applicable):

[) Have any consulting or advisory firms been contracted to support the procurement,
implementation, optimisation, or management of this system? - Yes/No

m) If yes, please provide the consulting firm's name —

n) Scope of consulting engagement (e.g. system selection, implementation support,
workflow optimisation, training, ongoing support) —

o) Consulting contract start date —

p) Consulting contract end date —

Remote consultation system provider (e.g. video and online consultations)
Induction Healthcare
Attend Anywhere
April 2021
March 2025
Information not held — this contract is procured nationally
Information not held — this contract is procured nationally
Information not held — this contract is procured nationally
Meditech Expanse
Information not held — this contract is procured nationally
Information not held — this contract is procured nationally
No

. No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
No applicable, as per A5l above
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Can you please provide your trust’s IT spend for the following financial year:
FY 2023-24.

Please include in your IT spend calculation the cost of your IT staff, Software, Services,
Hardware, Communication equipment and Other IT spend for the requested financial
year.

Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 -
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.



Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2023/2024 Disclosure
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 596:

https://www.alderhey.nhs.uk/about/foi/disclosure-logs/



https://www.alderhey.nhs.uk/about/foi/disclosure-logs/

