Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOIAH2425/426
Number:
From: Private Individual
Date: 01 November 2024
Subject: Radiology Reporting Services
Q1 The names of your outsourced teleradiology providers for:
a) Out of hours, emergency reporting (overnight reporting).
b) Routine Elective Reporting.
A1 a) Information not held- all emergency and out of hours reporting is done internally.
b) Medica Reporting Ltd
Q2 Please provide the annual volumes for both 2023 and for 2024 sent to each provider,
broken into the following:
a) Routine Elective Reporting (MRI, CT)
b) Overnight Emergency Routine
c¢) Plain Film Reporting
d) Day time emergency reporting (1hr for example).
e) Split into each hospital within the Trust
A2 a) 2023 - Routine Elective Reporting CT/MRI only - 3,244
2024 - Routine Elective Reporting CT/MRI only - 1,546
b-d) Information not held, as per A1a)
e) Not applicable, Alder Hey Children’s Hospital is the only hospital within the Trust.
Q3 Start date, duration and end date of any contracts with tele-radiology providers?
A3 Start date - 01/06/2024
Initial Contract Length - 36 Months
End Date - 31/05/2027
Q4 Was the contract procured via a framework (direct award), mini-tender, or ITT
procurement process?
A4 Framework- NHS Supply Chain
Q5 Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for this contract?
A5 Gemmel Johnston — Service Manager for Radiology



