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ADHD and ASD services 

Q1 Under the Freedom of Information Act, I am writing to request information regarding 
Autism Spectrum Disorder (ASD) and Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder (AHD) 
services 

  
A1 Please see attached 270 FOI Response 
  

 



Please complete all fields in light/dark grey. Please provide figures for the end of each financial year, where applicable.
ASD - autism spectrum disorder
ADHD - attention deficit hyperactivity disorder 

Name of your organisation: Alder Hey Childrens' Hospital NHS Foundation Trust

Questions Answers

1) Does your organisation commission or provide (please specify) referral, diagnosis or treatment services 
for the following?

Yes / no? Commission or provide?

a. ASD in children Yes Provider
b. ASD in adults
c. ADHD in children Yes Provider
d. ADHD in adults

2) Please provide an overview of the current digital and physical care pathways, from referral for 
assessment to diagnosis and long-term treatment, for each of the following.

Overview of digital care 
pathway

Overview of physical care pathway

a. ASD in children

b. ASD in adults

c. ADHD in children

d. ADHD in adults

3) Please provide each of the following, for each of the following financial years 2021/22, 2022/23 and 
2023/24, split by ASD in Children, ASD in adults, ADHD in children and ADHD in adults.

ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults
a. Number of:

i. People referred for diagnosis assessment

ii. People screened/triaged and subsequently not assessed 347 449 564 475 782 1367

iii. Diagnosis assessments completed 6337 1071 7086 1099 7480 2555

Please note, this is the 
number of attended 
diagnosis assessment 
appointments, not the 
number of assessment 
pathways (counts all 
assessments undertaken for 
each Child/Young Person)

iv. People subsequently diagnosed with the relevant condition

Information not held – the 
Trust does not routinely 

collate or hold this information 
centrally as part of its 

management or performance 
data. 

Information not held – the 
Trust does not routinely 

collate or hold this 
information centrally as 

part of its management or 
performance data. 

Information not held – the 
Trust does not routinely 

collate or hold this 
information centrally as 

part of its management or 
performance data. 

Information not held – the 
Trust does not routinely 

collate or hold this 
information centrally as 

part of its management or 
performance data. 

Information not held – 
the Trust does not 

routinely collate or hold 
this information 

centrally as part of its 
management or 

performance data. 

Information not held – 
the Trust does not 
routinely collate or 

hold this information 
centrally as part of its 

management or 
performance data. 

b. Average (mean) waiting time from referral to assessment (in weeks) 64.1 54 46.4 70 53.5 75

Please note, this is the 
average time from referral 
to first attended 
appointments

4) What was the total expenditure by your organisation on mental health services, for each of the 
following financial years 2021/22, 2022/23 and 2023/24?

2021/22 2022/23 2023/24

Total mental health services expenditure (£): 14,200,216.00£                           15,295,665.00£                                      19,841,889.00£                     

5)
Please provide each of the following expenditures by your organisation, for each of the following 
financial years 2021/22, 2022/23 and 2023/24, split by ASD in Children, ASD in adults, ADHD in children 
and ADHD in adults.

ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults

a. Total expenditure: 3,044,233.00£                        988,683.00£                           2,973,822.00£                  1,332,739.00£               

b. Split of expenditure:

i. Screening/triage of referrals

ii. Diagnosis assessments

iii. Post-diagnosis treatment (incl. medication)

iv. Post-diagnosis follow-up

v. Other (please specify)

Please note for the above:

The costs included are direct costs of running the services and do not include indirect costs, overheads or supporting management structure

Mental Health Investment has seen an increase in expenditure across the service due to Mental Health Investment and costs have also increased due to services transferring into the Mental Health division in 23/24

Prior to 22/23 ASD and ADHD costs were included within other services so we are unable to provide this information

We are unable to allocate drugs costs within ASD/ADHD service as these are coded within another service so noted that these have not been included

6) For all providers used since 2021/22 for the provision of ASD in Children, ASD in adults, ADHD in children 
or ADHD in adults services, please provide the following information.

a. Name of provider f. Number of people accessing their services commissioned by your organisation

Name NHS Independent ASD in children ASD in adults ADHD in children ADHD in adults Screening/triage 
 of referrals

Diagnosis assessments
Post-diagnosis 
treatment (incl. 

medication)

Post-diagnosis follow-
up

Other (please 
specify)

2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24

Provider 1 Healios No Yes Yes

No; Alder Hey Children's 
NHS Foundation Trust does 
not provide these services 

to adults

No

No; Alder Hey Children's 
NHS Foundation Trust does 
not provide these services 

to adults

No Yes No No Not applicable 150 500 360

4500

Information not held for 
2021/22 as do not hold this 

data at service level

Information not held for 
2021/22 as do not hold this 

data at service level

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, Alder Hey Children's 
NHS Foundation Trust does not 
provide these services to adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

 Information not held- 
unable to split 

expenditure by pathway 
stage 

No

No

Not applicable, Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust does not 
provide these services to adults

Not applicable, Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust does not 
provide these services to adults

2021/22

Please see attached ASD Pathway Process Flowchart

Please see attached ADHD Nurse Led Pathway

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

3545 3273

2021/22 2022/23 2023/24

3526

Information exempt under Section 43- by disclosing our annual spend in conjunction with the 
number of patients treated, this would allow cost per patient to be calculated and therefore 

the release of this information would allow competitors a significant competetive 
advantage and thus harm the commercial interests of our current supplier.

2022/23 2023/24

Not applicable, Alder Hey Children's 
NHS Foundation Trust does not 
provide these services to adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

Not applicable, 
Alder Hey 

Children's NHS 
Foundation Trust 
does not provide 
these services to 

adults

2293 4379

 Information not held- 
unable to split 
expenditure by 
pathway stage 

e. Total expenditure by your organisation on their servicesb. NHS or independent provider c. Categories of patients served d. Services provided for your organisation

 Information not held- 
unable to split expenditure 

by pathway stage 

 Information not held- 
unable to split expenditure 

by pathway stage 



Nurse Led 
ADHD 
Pathway



ASD Pathway Process Flowchart 

Referral accepted and triaged,
appointments decided based

on information 

START: Referral received
then screened

Referral returned 

Not enough
information

Child under 6yrs -
needs to see
Community

Paediatrician first

Referral more
appropriate for

another service (e.g.,
CAMHS, ADHD)

All young people to see a Speech & Language Therapist (SLT), other appointments may not be needed for
every young person

ADOS
Assessment

SLT Social Communication
Assessment 

Neurodevelopmental History 

Psychology-informed assessment
with a Specialist Practitioner

Clinical Psychology Assessment 

Joint Assessment with a SLT
AND:

Community Paediatrician
OR

Clinical Psychologist
OR

Consultant Psychiatrist
OR

Occupational Therapist
OR

Specialist Practitioner

School
Observation 

Occupational Therapy Motor or
Sensory Assessment 

Cognitive
Assessment

Discussion at
MDT 

Inconclusive -
further information

needed 

Opt-in
Letter for
Feedback

Session
Sent

Outcome shared at
feedback appointment OR

through report if no
response within 10 days

ASD Diagnosis agreed

ASD Diagnosis not given
at this time 

School/Nursery
Information

requested along with
any external reports,

e.g., Educational
Psychology

Appointments can be face to face or through video call. Home and school visits also offered.
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