Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOIAH2425/202

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 15 July 2024

Subject: Monthly patient data and test results for Pseudomonas Aeruginosa

Bacteraemia

Q1 Monthly patient data for Pseudomonas Aeruginosa Bacteraemia
- for 2013, 2014, 2015, 2016 and 2017

Including:

a) total number of patients tested

b) total number of patients confirmed as infected

c) total number of patients prescribed antibiotics

d) broken down by name of antibiotic prescribed if possible

A1 a-b)
Total Blood Culture Pseudomonas Positive
Orders Patients
2013 7,548 4
2014 7,328 6
2015 7,261 7
2016 6,958 5
2017 7,581 6

c-d) Information not held — the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information
centrally as part of its management or performance data. In order to confirm treatment
following medication being dispensed, the Trust would be required to access personal
data of the individuals and as such the data is exempt under Section 40: Personal data.

Q2 Monthly patient data for the tap/ sink water test results for Pseudomonas Aeruginosa
Bacteraemia- for 2014, 2015, 2016 and 2017

Including:

a) for the count per 100ml (or whatever volume was used for testing)
b) for the neonatal unit

c) for the neonatal ICU

d) for the paediatric Unit

e) or the maternity unit including post-natal wards

A2 a-d) Please see attached ‘202 FOI Response’. Please note that these results are from
2015-21 only. Preceding this, the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information



Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
centrally as part of its management or performance data.

e) Information not held- Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist
children’s hospital and does not provide maternity services.



Oncology - 38 AH1713774.
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Neonatal surgery - 1C AH1713766

Post Pre Pre Pre Pre

Pre

Outlet Room number Room name Tap type
1 01.01.0099 [WC access HwWB
2 01.01.0110 Bed 17 HwWB
3 01.01.0109 Bed 17 bathroom Shower
4 01.01.0109 Bed 17 bathroom HWB
5 01.01.0108 Bed 18 HWB
6 01.01.0107 Bed 18 bathroom Shower
7 01.01.0107 Bed 18 bathroom HWB
8 01.01.0106 Bed 19 HWB
9 01.01.0105 Bed 19 bathroom Shower
10 01.01.0105 Bed 19 bathroom HWB
11 01.01.0104 Bed 20 HWB
12 01.01.0103 Bed 20 bathroom Shower
13 01.01.0103 Bed 20 bathroom HWB near toilet
14 01.01.0103 Bed 20 bathroom HWB near shower
15 Store room (opposite bed 20)  [HWB
16 Store room ite bed 20) D
17 01.01.0053 Lobby for Bed 21 HWB
18 01.01.0051 Bed 21 HWB
19 01.01.0050 Bed 21 bathroom Shower
20 01.01.0050 Bed 21 bathroom HWB
21 01.01.0049 Bed 22 HWB
22 01.01.0048 Bed 22 bathroom Shower
23 01.01.0048 Bed 22 bathroom HWB
24 01.01.0047 Bed 23 HWB
25 01.01.0046 Bed 23 bathroom Shower
26 01.01.0046 Bed 23 bathroom HWB
27 01.01.0045 Bed 24 HWB
28 01.01.0044 Bed 24 bathroom Shower
29 01.01.0044 Bed 24 bathroom HWB
30 01.01.0059 Bathroom HWB
31 01.01.0059 Bathroom Bath main spout
32 01.01.0059 Bathroom Bath hose
33 01.01.0060 Clean utility HWB
34 Bed 26 HWB

09/03/2015] 24/09/2016] 28/09/2016

28/09/2016)

12/10/2016]

28/02/2017] 23/03/2017] 11/05/2017] 04/10/2017] 20/03/2018] 09/10/2018] 19/11/2018] 19/11/2018] 25/03/2019] 24/09/2019] 27/09/2019] 23/06/2020

11/03/2021




Critical care - 1B AH1713769 Results
Pre Flush- Post chlorination Pre Post Pre Pre Pre Post Pre Pre Pre Post Pre [NoFilter _[Filter [pre [Pre [pre
[Outlet | Room number Room name Tap type Tap number 08/03/2016_| 05/05/2016] 16/05/2016] 16/05/2016] 18/08/2016 20/09/2016 | 28/05/2016] 28/09/2016] 12/10/2016] 28/02/2017] 21/03/2017] 27/03/2017] 27/03/2017] 08/11/2017] 06/11/2018] 19/11/2018] 19/11/2018] 14/05/2019 | 25/06/2019 | 25/06/2019 | 16/12/2019 | 21/07/2020] 08/03/2021
1 02010012 |Mens change Shower 0 0 0
2 02010012 |Mens change HWE (in room) 0 0 0 0
3 02010012 |mens change HWE (in cubicle) 0 0 0 0
4 Jo2on0021  |we HWB _ 0 0 0 0 0
° [02.000011  [oomestic services HWB 0 0 0 0
© 02010022 |parents suite 2 HWB -1 0 ) 0 0
7
8 [02.01.0022 |parents suite 2 Shower [ 0 [ [
9 [02.01.0024 _|WC patient HWB 0 0 0 0
10 02.01.0025 Parents suite 1 HWB -1 0 0 0 0
11
2 102.01.005 _|parents suite 1 Shower 0 0 0 0
3 |02.000077 |staff change Shower - 1 (left) 0 0 0 0
™ 02010077 |staff change Shower - 2 (right) 0 0 0 0
5 [02.01.0077 _|staff change HWB - 0 0 0 0 0 0
6 Jo2.010010 |oisposal hold D 0 0 0 0
v Staff change HWB Tap number 002853 0 0 0 0
" lororo11s | weaccessible toitet HWB 0 0 0 0
» 02.01.0114 Pantry HWB 0 [] 0 ]
20 Jo2.01.0114 [Pantry D 0 0 0 0
21 fo2.07.0112  |wcstaff HWB 0
22 02.01.0052 _|staff rest HWB _ o [ [ o 1 4
% 02010158 |on call bedroom HWB 0 0 0 0
24 o2.01.0094 |we staff HWB 0 0 o
% 102.01.0095 |pomestic services b i 0 0 0 0
% )o2010148  |oirty utility HWB ° 0 0 0 1 0 0 1 0 0
27 |oz.01.0148 |pirty utility D i 0 0 0 0
28 102.01.0146  |Bed14 HWB o 0 o 0
2 lozoro161  |Bed1s HWB 0 0 0 0
* lo2010160 |sed1s HWB 0 0 0 -
* lozor0150  |sed17 HWB 0 0 1 1 0 0
32 fo2.01.0158  [Bed1s HWB 0 0 0 0
33 [02.010157  [Bed1o HWB 0 0 0 0
34 [o2.01.0156 [Bed20 HWB 0 0 0 0
35 fo2.010151  |[Bed21 HWB 0 0 0 0
36 102.01.0056  |Dirty utility HWB 0 0 0 0
37 [02.01.0056 |oirty utility b 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
3 |ozor005  [sed22 Hws 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
39 [02.01.0053  |Bed 22 lobby HWB 0 0 0 0
40 o2010049  |Bed23 HwB 0 0 0
41 02.01.0048 Bed 24 HWB 0 [} 0
42 [02.01.0047  [Bed2s HWB 0 0 0 8
43 Jo201.0046  |Bed26 HWB 0 - 0
* lo20100a5  |sed2r HWB 0 0 2
4 lo2010044  |Bed2s HWB 0 0 0
% o2010059  |sed 29 HWB 0 0 0 0
47 102010097 |wc accessible toilet HWB 0 0 0 0
* lozovooss  |weaccessibe toiet HWB 0 0 0 0
** Jo2010100 |pomestic services D 0 0 0 0
% 02.01.0137 Dirty utility HWB 0 0 0 0 0 0 [} 0 o
51 ]02.01.0137 Dirty utility D 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0




92 fo2.010135  [seds HWB 0 0 1
53 lo2010168  |Bed7 HWB 0 0 0
54 [0201.0167  |Beds HWB 0 0 [
55 [02.01.0166  |Bedo HWB Tap number 002720 o [ o
56 02010165 [Bed10 HWB [ 0 [
57 |o201.0164  |Bed11 HWB o [ o
58 02010163 |Bed12 HWB o o
59 02.01.0143  |Near patient testing D 0 0 0 0 0
32 102.01.0143 |Near patient testing HWB
% Jo2010141  |Bed 1310bby HWB 0 0 0
61 102.01.0140  |Bed13 HWB 0 0 4
62 Dirty utility HWB 0 0 0
63 Dirty utility D 0 0 0
64 ]02.01.0061 |Bed 30 HWB 0 0
65 |oz 010060 |Bed 31 HWB 0 o
66 lo201.0041  |Bed32 HWB 0 [
67 02010040  |[Bed33 HWB 0 0
02.01.0039 __|Bed 34 HWB 0
Bed 35 HWB 0 0
70 Jo201.0037  |Bed3s HwB 0 0
™ lozo010036  |ed37 HwB 0 0 0 0
72 [02.01.0067 _|Bed3s HWB
7 |oz 010066 [Bed 39 HwB 0 0
74 02.01.0104 | W accessible toilet HWB 0 )
7> 102010132 |Between Burns and theatre access Hwa 0 0
76 [02.01.0108 |Pharmacy resource HWB 0 0
77 102.01.0108 __|pharmacy resource D 0 0
Milk kitchen HWB 0 0
Milk kitchen D
Dirty utility HWB 0
Dirty utility D (]
Bed 40 HWB 0
Bed 40 lobby HWB 0
Bed 41 HWB 0
Bed 42 HWB []
Bed 43 HWB []
. Bed 44 HwB )
88 |o 01.0028 _[Bed 45 HWB [ 0
89 02010027 |Bedds HWB 0 0
Bed 47 HWB 0 ]
Bed 48 HwB 0 0
9 |ooroi9 omyuiny e | | I
93 [02.01.0129 Dirty utility [ 0 0
131 [02.1.0127 __|Sink next to dirty utility before beds 1-5___|HWB
% |o2oro77  [sed1 HWB 0 0
% 02010176 |Bed 1 ensuite |shower 0 _
% 02010176 |sed 1 ensuite HWB 0 0
97 02010175 |Bed2 HWB 0 [
% 02010174 |Bed 2 ensuite |shower 0 0
9 [02.010174  [Bed 2 ensuite HWB 0 0
100 102.01.0173  [Bed3 HWB 0 [
101 102.01.0172  |Bed 3 ensuite [shower 0 [
102 102.01.0172  |Bed 3 ensuite HWB 0 0
103 102010171 |Bed4 HWB 0 0
104 102010170 |Bed 4 ensuite Shower o
ﬂ'&zm 0170 Bed 4 ensuite hws 0 [)
106 102.01.0169  |BedS HWB 0 0




107 {02.01.0168 Bed 5 ensuite |§hower 0 0 0
% 02010168 |Bed 5 ensuite HwB 0 0 0
% f02.01.0131 |pomestic services D 0 0 0
110 102.01.0125 _|play area opposite bed 1 D i 0 ) 0
11 105010123 |ivprep HWB 0 0 0 0 0
112 10501.0122  [Assessment room HWB 0 0
113 102.01.0179 _|Treatment bathroom HWB - 1 (white) 0 0 0 0
114 102.01.0179 __|Treatment bathroom HWB - 2 (silver) [ [ [
115 102.01.0179 _|Treatment bathroom Bath main spout 0 0
116 102.01.0179 _|Treatment bathroom Bath left hose 0 0
117 {02.01.0179 Treatment bathroom Bath right hose 0
118 102.01.0121  pantry o ion - 1 (left) 0 0 0
19 f0201.0121  |pantry o ion - 2 (right) 0 0
Therapy HWB 0 0 0
Therapy [} i 0 0 0
W staff HWB 0 0 0
[Sink next to lounge HWB Tap number 003049 0 0 0
WC accessible toilet HWB 0 0 0
g e 1 — | I |
Staff change HWB -2 Tap number 002771 0 0 0 0 0
Staff change |shower 0 0 0
129 loz.01.0185  |wc HWB 0 0 0
130 )02.01.0184 Iitaff rest HWB 0 0 0
31 | HWB




Ward 3¢ - AH1713776
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Theatre 8

Results
Pre Post
Outlet |[Room number |Room name Tap type 16/06/2016| 25/06/2016] 25/06/2016
1 Scrub sink left tap Decontamination
2 Scrub sink right tap Decontamination
3 03.01.0156 Anaesthetic room HWB
4 Dirty utility, cold tap Decontamination
5 Dirty utility, hot tap Decontamination 0
6 Dirty utility HWB 0
Bed wash Results
Pre Post
Outlet |Room number |Room name Tap type 11/01/2017 13/01/2017'13.1417
1 Bed wash (left hand side sink) Decontamination
2 Bed wash (right hand side sink) Decontamination




Ward 3A Results
Pre Post
Outlet [Room number |Room name [Tap type 28/02/2017] 15/03/2018| 15/03/2018 |
1 Arjo bath spout [tap 0 |
BE— T |
Ward 4A Results
Outlet [Room number |Room name Tap type 28/02/2017] 03/12/2019)]
1 Arjo bath spout Tap )
2 Arjo bath hose Shower
3 Bed 10 HWB 0
4 Bed 10 Bathroom HWB (]
5 Bed 11 HWB 0
6 Bed 11 Bathroom HWB 0
Ward 4B Results
22/02/2018
Outlet [Room number |Room name Tap type 28/02/2017]Pre Post
1 Arjo bath spout Tap 0 )
2| | Ario bath hose Shower 0 0
3 | | Bathroom sink Tap 0
Ward 4C Results
Outlet [Room number JRoom name Trap type 28/02/2017] | |
1 Arjo bath spout [Tap [ | |
L2 ] | Arjo bath hose [shower o | | |




OoPD Results

Outlet [Room number |Room name [Tap type 28/02/2017] | | | | | | |
T Beko bath spout | o | | | | | | | |




Ward_| Outlet number |Room number Room name [Water result of outlet Swab type 21/05/2019 29/05/2019 04/06/2019 11/06/2019 19/06/2019 15/08/2019
Sink No growth No growth No growth No growth No growt No growth
wic Outlet 8 01.01.0106 Bed 19 No growth 25/03/19  [Under filter No growth No growth No growth No growth No growt No growth
Side o fiter No growth No growth No growth No growth No growt No growth
Sink
wic Outlet 27 01.01.0045 Bed 24 No growth 25/03/19  [Under filter No growth No growtt No growt No growtt No growt No growt
Side of fiter No growth No growt No growt No growt No growt No growt
. No growt No growt No growt No growt No growt
wic Outlet 24 01.01.0047 Bed 23 Pse“d"g‘/";‘:/s ]';"‘“Ed No growt No growt No growt No growt No growt
Side o fiter No growt No growt No growt No growt No growth
. Sink No growt No growt No growt No growt
wis Outlet 61 02.01.0140 Bed 13 Pseudomonas isolated No growth No growt No growt No growt No growt
Side o fiter No growth No growt No growt No growt No growt
Sink No growt No growt No growt No growt No growth
wis Outlet 28 02.01.0146 Bed 14 No growth 14/05/19  |Under flter No growth No growt No growt No growt No growt No growth
Side o fiter No growth No growth No growth No growth No growth No growth
Pseudomonas isolated
w1 Outlet 35 02.01.0151 Bed 21 /05715 No growtt No growtt No growt
Side o fiter No growt No growt No growt No growth
- Sink No growt No growt No growt No growt No growth
Pseud lated
wis Outlet 67 02.01.0040 Bed 33 e o [under filter No growth No growtl No growtl No growtl No growt
Side of fiter No growth No growt No growt No growt No growt

Ward 1C
Ward 18

Date on filter
Date on filter

03/04/2019
20/05/2019

24/05/2019
20/05/2019

24/05/2019
20/05/2019

24/05/2019
20/05/2019

15/08/2019
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