Alder Hey Children’s NHS'|

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOIAH2324/596

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 24 January 2024

Subject: Contactsand spend for IT

Q1 Can you advise me on who are the Key People to talk to in the organisation ref ICT

Al

including Name, Email Address, Phone Number and Full Address

a) Purchasing Manager

b) Head ICT

c) Desktops/Notebook Manager

d) ICT Director

e) Service Delivery Manager
f) ICT Project Managers

Job Role Name | E Mail

a) Purchasing Information Not held — we do not have this job role within the
Manager ICT department

b) Head ICT Joe Mclntyre joe.mcintyre@alderhey.nhs.uk

c) Desktops/Notebook
Manager

Staff names exempted under Section 40: Personal Information.
Although the information relates to their public role and
accountability for managing budgets, disclosure of names of all
individuals may potentially have adverse consequences to the
employees. Any names of staff that are available in the public
domain are accessible via our website

e https://alderhey.nhs.uk/

d) ICT Director

Leanne Fearnehough | Leanne.Fearnehough@alderhey.nhs.uk

e) Service Delivery
Manager

Information Not held — we do not have this job role within the
ICT department

f) ICT Project
Managers

Staff names exempted under Section 40: Personal Information.
Although the information relates to their public role and
accountability for managing budgets, disclosure of names of all
individuals may potentially have adverse consequences to the
employees. Any names of staff that are available in the public
domain are accessible via our website

e https://alderhey.nhs.uk/

Phone Numbers and Full Address:
Information not held — Many staff in this area now adopt an agile approach to working
meaning they do not have a set workspace with direct telephone contact.

Staff use email as their main method of correspondence or may be contacted via the


mailto:joe.mcintyre@alderhey.nhs.uk
https://alderhey.nhs.uk/
mailto:Leanne.Fearnehough@alderhey.nhs.uk
https://alderhey.nhs.uk/

Q2
A2

Alder Hey Children’s NHS'|

NHS Foundation Trust
hospital switchboard. The address is of the hospital is as follows:

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Eaton Road,

Liverpool,

L12 2AP

What is your annual ICT Spend 2023/2024

£5,800,000



