
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOIAH2324/582 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

22 January 2024 

Subject: 
 

Gas and electricity contracts 

 
I am writing to submit a Freedom of Information (FOI) request regarding information related to the 
organisation’s gas and electricity contracts, as well as details on the energy management system. 
 
Gas and Electricity Contracts; 
  
Q1 Energy Provider 
  
A1 Brooke Green Supply Ltd 
  
Q2 Annual Spend for each provider for the past 3 financial years. 
  
A2 2021 – £521,533  

2022 – £449,954  
2023 - £711,495  

  
Q3 Contract Duration (Including any extensions) 
  
A3 2 years 
  
Q4 Contract start date 
  
A4  01/04/2024 
  
Q5 Contract Expiry Date 
  
A5 31/03/2026 
  
Q6 Contract Review Dates 
  
A6 01/09/2025 
  
Q7 Contact details of the person responsible, including job title 
  
A7 Alex Pitman, Alec.pitman@alderhey.nhs.uk, Green Project director 
  
Q8 Total Consumption of Gas, please provide me with the latest figure in cubic metres. 
  
A8 17,400,000 kWh 
  
Q9 Total Consumption of Electricity (NHH), please provide me with latest figure in kWh for the 

past 3 financial years 
  
A9 450,000 kWh 



 
  
Q10 Total Consumption of Electricity (HH), please provide me with latest figure in kWh for the 

past 3 financial years. 
  
A10 Mean of 16,500,000 kWh 
  
Q11 Contact details of the person responsible, including job title at the very least 
  
A11 Alex Pitman, Alec.pitman@alderhey.nhs.uk, Green Project director 
  
Q12 Energy Management System Contract(s) - Contract(s) relating to the organisation’s 

energy management system. An energy management system (EMS) is a system of 
computer-aided tools used by operators of electric utility grids to monitor, control, and 
optimise the performance of the generation or transmission system. 
Energy Management System Provider. 

a. Annual Spend 
b. Contract Duration (Including any extensions) 
c. Contract Expiry Date 
d. Contract start date 
e. Contract Review Date 
f. Contract Description – A description of the services provided. 
g. Brand of the software 
h. Total number of meter points for electricity: 

i. Non-Half Hourly (NHH) meter points 
ii. Half Hourly (HH) meter points 

i. . Total number of Gas meter points 
j. Total number of meter points for specialist gases and liquids 
k. Contact details of the person responsible, including job title 

  
A12 a. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 

b. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 
c. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 
d. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 
e. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 
f. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 
g. Information not held – no Energy Management System used 
h. 8  

i. 5 
ii. 3 

i. 6 
j. Zero 
k. Alex Pitman, Alec.pitman@alderhey.nhs.uk, Green Project Director 

  
  
 


