Alder Hey Children's [\Y/153

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOIAH2425/471

Number:

From: Other

Date: 19 November 2024

Subject: Number of consultant anaesthetists

Q1 How many male substantive consultant anaesthetists employed in your organisation?
A1 38

Q2 How many female substantive consultant anaesthetists employed in your organisation?
A2 20

Q3 Do you have a ‘Lead Consultant/Clinical Lead for Regional Anaesthesia’?

a. What is their gender?

A3 Information not held - This is not applicable to Alder Hey, there is no such role as Lead
for Regional Anaesthesia.

Q4 Do you have a ‘Lead Consultant/Clinical Lead for Obstetric Anaesthesia’?
a. What is their gender?

A4 Information is not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist
children’s hospital does not have a maternity ward or any maternity related services

Q5 Do you have a ‘Departmental Lead for Anaesthesia’ or equivalent role?
a. What is their gender?

A5 We have two clinical leads for Anaesthesia. 1 male. 1 female.



