

Reference

FOIAH2324/527

Number: From:

Other

Date:

27 December 2023

Subject:

Implementation of Getting it Right First Time (GIRFT) pathway for suspected

Cauda Equina Syndrome (CES)

- Q1 Has your Trust implemented GIRFT pathway for suspected Cauda Equina Syndrome (CES) in all of its hospitals?
- A1 Information not held Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital and does not routinely treat Cauda Equina Syndrome.
- Q2 If the answer to Q1 is affirmative, please advise when it was implemented and advise on the following:
 - a. Number of CES related training to staff in the period since implemented compared to the same period duration prior to implementation.
 - Number of MRI scans undertaken for suspected CES in the period since implemented compared to the same period duration prior to implementation.
 - c. Average time between MRI referral and performance of the scan for suspected CES in the period since implemented compared to the same period duration prior to implementation.
 - d. Number of patients who underwent surgery for CES in the period since implemented compared to the same period duration prior to implementation.
 - e. Breakdown of feedback raised by clinicians with your Trust regarding implementation of the pathway including total number of clinicians who provided feedback, whether positive or or negative and its nature (for example resource issue /training/delays/patient safety).

A2 Information not held – as per A1

- Q3 If the answer to Q1 is negative, please state:
 - a. If only some hospitals within your Trust implemented the pathway, please state which ones did not and the reason why.
 - b. What other policy is followed with regards to the diagnosis and management of CES?
 - c. Are the plans for the pathway to be implemented in the future and if so when? If not, why not?
 - d. Breakdown of feedback raised by clinicians with your Trust regarding lack of implementation of the pathway including total number of clinicians who provided feedback, whether positive or negative and its nature (for example resource issue /training/delays/patient safety).