
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOIAH2324/422 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

02 November 2023 

Subject: 
 

The staff name and email for department leads & execs 

 
 
Q1 I would like to request information on staff contacts under the provisions of the Freedom of 

Information Act.   
  
My request: The staff name and email for the following job titles (or closest to):   

a. Chief Operating Officer   
b. Deputy Chief Operating Officer   
c. Director Of Operations for all specialties  
d. Director of Performance   
e. Elective Care Director   
f. Director of Transformation  
g. Head of Transformation  
h. Data Quality Lead  
i. RTT Director   
j. Associate Directors of Operations for all specialties  
k. Associate Directors of Performance   
l. Associate Director of Elective Care   
m. Associate Director of RTT   
n. Head of Operations   
o. Head of Performance   
p. Head of Elective Care   
q. Head of RTT   
r. Operations Manager for all specialties  
s. Performance Manager   
t. Elective Care Manager   
u. RTT Manager   
v. Booking Manager   
w. Head of department for all specialties  
x. General Manager for all specialties  
y. Service Manager for all specialties  
z. Clinical Matron for all specialties  
aa. Clinical Director for all specialties  
bb. Clinical Lead for all specialties  
cc. Head of Patient Access   
dd. Head of Outpatients   

  
A1 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’ 
 
This information is available on our website, with the exception of c, f, g, h, z, aa & bb and 
can be found in our 22/23 Disclosure Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 123: 
 
https://www.alderhey.nhs.uk/about/foi/disclosure-logs/ 



 
 
c. Information not held - job title does not exist within Trust. 
 
f &g. This role falls under the remit of our Chief Digital and Transformation Officer 
 Kate Warriner. 
 
h. Information not held – this post is currently vacant. 
 
z. Information not held - job title does not exist within Trust. 
 
aa.  
Developmental Paediatrics – Dr Zaby Bassi 
Psychiatry – Dr S Al-Bachari 
Anesthetics – Dr W Gauntlett & Dr S Syed 
Burns & Plastics, & Laser – Mr P Sharma 
Cardiac & Cardiology – Mr R Guerrero 
Critical Care – Ms M Horan 
Neurosurgery & Craniofacial – Mr C Mallucci 
ENT & Audiology – Mr S Sharma 
Cleft, Dental & Oral Surgery – MR C Sweet 
Ophthalmology – Mr J Gonzalez-Martin 
Spinal Surgery – Mr N Davidson 
Trauma & Orthopaedics – Mr D Wright 
Major Trauma – Dr S Stibbards 
Paediatric Surgery & Urology – Ms J Minford 
Urgent Care, Gen Paediatrics, Diabetes & ED – Dr B Mehta 
Medical Care – Cancer Services, Specialist & Complex – Dr J Mwenechanya 
Laboratory Medicine – Darren Powell 
Diagnostics and Clinical Services - Caren Landes 
Radiology/Imaging - Musa Kaleem 
 
bb.  
Specialist Mental Health Liverpool - Dr L Neil 
Specialist Mental Health Sefton - Dr V Killen 
Crisis Care Team - Dr V Crosbie 
Mental Health Support Team (MHST) - Suzanne Hutchinson 
Sunflower House (T4 Unit) - Andrea O’Donnell 
Eating Disorder Service - Dr Crosbie 
Clinical Health Psychology - Dr V Gray / Dr Twigg 
SEND Team - Jenny Grimes 
Complex Discharge Team - Cathryn Livingston 
Theatres – Steve Roberts & Papari Deka 

  
 


