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Q1 The average time to hire for Bank workers for each Trust for the last 12 months   

a. Locum 
b. Nurse 
c. Allied Health Professional 
d. Non-Medical, Non-Clinical 

  
A1 a. Information not held - the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information 

centrally as part of its management or performance data.  
b. 30 days 
c. 17 days 
d. 14 days 

  
Q2 What are your hardest roles to fill currently?  
  
A2 The Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) gives rights of public access to information 

held by public authorities; this information is not held in recorded format. 
  
Q3 Payment arrangements for Bank worker induction and mandatory training, number of 

hours paid and what level of payment is made on AFC scale?  
a. Locum 
b. Nurse 
c. AHP 
d. NMNC 

  
A3 Information not held - Pay specifically for induction and mandatory training is not 

recorded. 
  

 


