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Number:  

FOIAH2324/372 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

10 October 2023 

Subject: 
 

Estates department contacts 

 
 
Q1 Could you please provide me with names, email addresses & Telephone numbers of the 

following Estates department contacts.  
   

a. Head of Estates  
b. Estates Manager  
c. Estates Mechanical Engineer/officer  
d. Capital project manager   

  
A1 a. Graeme Dixon, Head of Estates, Graeme.Dixon@alderhey.nhs.uk 

b. As per A1a 
c. Information not held – no such role 
d. Jim O'Brien, Jim.OBrien@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
Information not held – Many staff in this area now adopt an agile approach to working 
meaning they do not have a set workspace with direct telephone contact. Staff use email 
as their main method of correspondence or may be contacted via the hospital 
switchboard. 

  
 


