

Reference FOIAH2324/345

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 22 September 2023

**Subject:** Screening and Immunisation

We are trying to identify the School Aged Immunisation Service team/Screening and Immunisation Teams.

I would appreciate it if you could provide me with:

- Q1 Confirmation of the immunisation or screening service
- A1 Information not held We do not currently have a formal vaccination team at Alder Hey.
- Q2 Location of the screening or immunisation service
- A2 Information not held as per A1
- Q3 Named individuals of the teams and their roles
  - a. Immunisation Team Operational Manager
  - b. Immunisation Lead Nurse
  - c. Immunisation Lead
  - d. Programme Lead
  - e. Immunisation Programme Lead
  - f. School Nurse
  - g. Immunisation Coordinator
  - h. Lead Nurse for SIT Team
  - i. Principal Screening & Immunisation Lead
  - j. Local Area Lead
  - k. Place Based Lead
  - I. Programme Manager
  - m. Principal Screening & Immunisation Manager
- A3 Information not held as per A1
- Q4 What type of vaccines are being offered
- A4 We have offered seasonal flu and COVID vaccines. We have also offered routine vaccines on an ad hoc basis to inpatients