Reference
Number:
From:
Date:

Subject:

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
FOIAH2324/312
Private Individual
06 September 2023

Details of Trust IT systems

Please provide information regarding the following systems:

Q1 Document Management

a)
b)
c)
d)
e)
f)l

9)
h)

System type —
Supplier name -

System name -

Date installed -

Contract expiration -

s this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
Procurement framework -

i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —

k)
A1 Inf
Q2 eP
a)
b)
c)
d)
e)
f) 1

o))
h)

Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender
ormation not held — this is an internal solution, as part of the staff intranet page.
OA (Electronic Pre-Operative Assessment)

System type —
Supplier name -

System name -

Date installed -

Contract expiration -

s this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
Procurement framework -

i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —

k)

A2

SQ T D0 QOO0 T

Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

. EPR (Electronic Patient Record)
. Meditech UK

. Meditech

. July 2015

. 31/03/2025.

No
No

. HealthTrust Europe framework is used.

i. Contract value is £687,617.92.
j. £687,617.92
k. None



Q3

A3

Q4

A4

Q5

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

EPR (Electronic Patient Record)
a) System type —

)
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e)
f

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

. EPR (Electronic Patient Record)
. Meditech UK

. Meditech

. July 2015

. 31/03/2025.

No

No

. HealthTrust Europe framework is used.
i. Contract value is £687,617.92.

j. £687,617.92

k. None

QS0 Qo0 TO

Finance

a) System type —

b) Supplier name -

c) System name -

d) Date installed -

e) Contract expiration -

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

a. ERP (Enterprise Resource Management)
b. NEP Cloud
c. NEP Cloud
d. 01/04/2018
e. 31/03/2025
f. No

g.No

h. NHS SBS

i. None

j. £574,854.00
k.None

Finance Bl and analytics system
a) System type —
b) Supplier name -



Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e) Contract expiration -
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

A5 There is no single system for Finance Bl and analytics system.
Finance system - as per A4

Bl and analytics system
Microsoft

No

) Information not held — this is part of the national Microsoft agreement
Data warehouse platform, Meditech Data Repository

j) £34,823.00

k) None
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Q6 HR
a) System type —
b) Supplier name -
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e) Contract expiration -
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender
A6 Electronic Staff Record (ESR)
IBM
ESR
September 2007
30/09/2023
No
No
COCH
The rostering and expenses systems used within the Trust
£47, 0967
None

AT T TQ 0200w

Q7 Maternity
a) System type —
b) Supplier name -



A7

Q8

A8

Q9

A9

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e) Contract expiration -
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children’s
hospital and does not provide maternity services.

Pathology PACS

a) System type —

b) Supplier name -

) System name -

) Date installed -

) Contract expiration -

) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

c
d
e
f

a. Pathology PACS

b. Philips

c. Vue PACS

d. July 2013

e. June 2023

f. No

g. Yes

h. Direct award has been made to Philips for a 10 year contract
i. Meditech, CRIS, ISP
j. £1.3M

k. None

Payroll

a) System type —

b) Supplier name -

c) System name -

d) Date installed -

e) Contract expiration -

f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -

i) Other systems it integrates with? —

j) Total value of contract (£) —

k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

a. Electronic Staff Record (ESR)
b. IBM



Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
ESR
September 2007
30/09/2023
No
No
COCH
The rostering and expenses systems used within the Trust
£47, 0967
None
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Q10  Population health management
a) System type —
b) Supplier name -
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e) Contract expiration -
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

A10 Information not held — no specific system in place.

Q11 Procurement Software
a) System type —
b) Supplier name -
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e) Contract expiration -
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -
i) Other systems it integrates with? —
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

A11 Procurement Services for the Trust are provided by Health Procurement Liverpool, which
is part of the Walton Centre.

Please re-direct your request to: wcf-tr.healthprocurementliverpool@nhs.net

Q12  Voice recognition
a) System type —
b) Supplier name -
c) System name -
d) Date installed -
e) Contract expiration -
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
h) Procurement framework -
i) Other systems it integrates with? —



Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
j) Total value of contract (£) —
k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender
A12 Provision of Speech Recognition Software
3M Modal
Fluency Direct
01/04/2017
31/03/2024
No
No
NHS SBS
Meditech / Medisec
£341,430
None
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