

Reference FOIAH2324/297 Number:

From: Private Individual

**Date:** 25 August 2023

Subject: Wait times for cancer treatment

- Q1 The number of people at your trust currently receiving treatment for cancer?
- A1 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- Q2 The number of people at your trust currently waiting to receive treatment for cancer?
- A2 Zero
- Q3 How long has the person who has waited the longest been waiting?
- A3 Information not held a per A2
- Q4 The number of people waiting to start cancer treatment, as measured from the date of urgent referral, who have waited longer than:
  - a. 62 days,
  - b. 3 months,
  - c. 4 months
  - d. 6 months,
  - e. 12 months
- A4 Zero as paediatric pathway is 31 days.
- Q5 The single longest wait to start cancer treatment, as measured from the date of the urgent referral, for each of the last three years?
- A5 2021 49 days 2022 - 40 days 2023 (to date) - 32 days