

Reference Number: FOIAH2324/286
From: Other
Date: 22 August 2023
Subject: Details of Neurology Workforce

Please could you provide the following (including both the number of individuals and FTE for each question, and job titles where asked):

Q1 The number of neurologists employed within your Trust

A1 6

Q2 The total number of neurologists
a. Number:
b. FTE

A2 a. 6
b. 5.3

Q3 The number of which are adult neurologists
a. Number:
b. FTE

A3 Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital and does not treat adults.

Q4 The number of which are paediatric neurologists
a. Number:
b. FTE

A4 As per A2

Q5 How many adult neurologists are epileptologists?
a. Number:
b. FTE

A5 Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital and does not treat adults.

Q6 How many paediatric neurologists are epileptologists?
a. Number:
b. FTE

A6 a. 2
b. 1.8

Q7 If you do not employ neurologists, please provide details of who provides your neurology

services

- A7 Information not held – all neurologists are employed
- Q8 The number of epilepsy specialist nurses (ESNs) employed within your Trust,
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A8 a. 4
b. 3
- Q9 The number of which are adult ESNs
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A9 Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital and does not treat adults.
- Q10 The number of which are paediatric ESNs
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A10 a. 4
b. 3
- Q11 How many adult ESNs have Learning Disability expertise?
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A11 Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital and does not treat adults.
- Q12 How many paediatric ESNs have Learning Disability expertise?
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A12 a. 4
b. 3
- Q13 The number of learning disability nurses who have epilepsy expertise
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A13 a. 0
b. 0
- Q14 The number of staff working within obstetrics who have epilepsy expertise, and their job titles
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A14 a. 0
b. 0

- Q15 Within this number, how many midwives have epilepsy expertise?
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A15 Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital and does not provide maternity services.
- Q16 The number of staff working within neurology who have expertise in obstetrics, and their job titles
a. Number:
b. FTE
- A16 a. 0
b. 0