Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOIAH2324/273

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 17 August 2023

Subject: Providers of Bank Staff

Q1 Please state which 3 party providers manage your staff banks for the following staffing

groups and the contract expiry date for each.
Note: if there is no 3rd party provider please confirm if the staff banks are managed
inhouse or if there is no staff bank

a. Medical and Dental

b. Nursing and Midwifery

c. AHP and HSS

d. Admin and Clerical

A1 a. Managed in house
b-d. NHS Professionals contract - expiry date is 31/07/2024

Q2 Please state the average fill rate for each staff bank for the past 12 months.
A2 a. Information not held — as per A1a
b. 77%
c. 60.20%
d. 90%
Q3 If any contracts are due to expire in the next 12 months, are they likely to be extended or

put out to tender?
A3 Information not held - The Trust has not made a decision in relation to this.

Q4 Please set out the agency and bank spend for each of these staffing groups for the
financial year 2022-2023

A4 Bank spend 2022/23 | Agency spend 2022/23
Medical and Dental Information not held — as per Ala
Nursing and Midwifery £6,705,124 £169,154
AHP and HSS £407,004 £225,841
Admin and Clerical £964,882 £329,313




