

Reference

FOIAH2324/234

Number: From:

Private Individual

Date:

28 July 2023

Subject:

Gender identity training for staff

What training has been delivered to staff within the Trust relating to gender identity, within the period 1<sup>st</sup> August 2022 to 1<sup>st</sup> August 2023?

I would like a list of all the sessions delivered to staff. If a course has been delivered multiple times, please list each instance separately. For each one, I would like to know:

- a. What was the session title or topic (if known)?
- b. Was the session delivered (even if only partially) by someone external to the Trust?
- c. If so, who?
- d. How much was paid to them for this?
- A1 Information not held there has been no training specific to gender identity in this period. However, all staff are required to undertake training on equality, diversity and Human Rights every 3 years via the national core skills training programme.
  - a. Equality, Diversity and Human Rights
  - b. No, this is a national online training module
  - c. Information not held not applicable as per A1b
  - d. Information not held not applicable as per A1b