

Reference FOIAH2324/204 Number:

From: Press/Media

Date: 13 July 2023

Subject: Spend for junior Doctor's pay and agency cover

- Q1 When junior doctors are not on strike, how much is the average consultant at your trust paid for the following:
  - a. Day shift
  - b. Night shift
- A1 a. Day shift = £389.90
  - b. Night shift =  $\pounds 694.37$
- Q2 When junior doctors are not on strike, how much is the average junior doctor at your trust paid for the following:
  - a. Day shift
  - b. Night shift
- A2 a. own hourly rate

b.

ST4
250
2 2 C . /

Full shift / on site response / telephone consultation					
F1	F2 & CT1-2 & ST 1-2	ST3	ST4		
£35	£60	£70	£70		

- Q3 Over the days 13th, 14th, 15th March and 11th, 12th, 13th, 14th April 2023, when Junior doctors were on strike, how much was the average consultant at your trust paid to cover a junior doctor's shift for:
  - a. Day shift
  - b. Night shift

A3	Wee	Overnight	
	07:00 - 19:00	19:00 – 23:00	23:00 - 07:00
	£161 / hour	£215 / hour	£269 / hours

- Q4 How much did the trust spend on senior doctors/consultants' salaries in total to cover the junior doctors' shifts when the junior doctors were on strike in March and April 2023?
  - a. 13th March -
  - b. 14th March-
  - c. 15th March -



- d. 11th April -
- e. 12th April -
- f. 13th April -
- g. 14th April -
- A4 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data. We are unable to breakdown the spend information for specific days
- Q5 How much did the trust spend on senior doctor/consultants' salaries in total on dates in March and April 2023 when junior doctors were **not** on strike?
  - a. 20th March -
  - b. 21st March -
  - c. 22nd March -
  - d. 18th April -
  - e. 19th April -
  - f. 20th April -
  - g. 21st April -
- A5 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data. We are unable to breakdown the spend information for specific days
- Q6 During the junior doctors strike days in March and April 2023, how much did your trust spend on locum/agency staff to cover shifts?
  - a. 13th March -
  - b. 14th March-
  - c. 15th March -
  - d. 11th April -
  - e. 12th April -
  - f. 13th April -
  - g. 14th April -

A6

- a. £0.00
  - b. £159.56
  - c. £1,588.00
  - d. £602.10
  - e. £1,421.63
  - f. £1,421.63
  - q. £3,060.69
- Q7 How much extra money did your trust pay during the junior doctors' strike days (13th, 14th, 15th March and 11th, 12th, 13th, 14th April) in total?
- A7 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data. We are unable to breakdown the spend information for extra money spent
- Q8 How did your trust afford to pay for extra locum staff/ agency staff/ senior doctors/consultants to cover junior doctors' shifts during the strike days in March and April 2023? Where did the money come from?



- A8 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data
- Q9 How much did your trust spend on giving locum shifts to junior doctors during the strike days in March and April 2023?
  - a. 13th March -
  - b. 14th March-
  - c. 15th March -
  - d. 11th April -
  - e. 12th April -
  - f. 13th April -
  - g. 14th April
- A9 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data. We are unable to breakdown the spend information for specific days
- Q10 How many junior doctors who were on strike from your trust were employed as locums on strike days in March? And in April? (please supply individual figures for each month)
- A10 Zero