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Consent for General Anaesthesia 

Patient Name: 

Date of Birth:                                                    Male ❑    Female ❑ 

AH No:                                                              NHS No: 

Name of the procedure for which a general anaesthetic is required: 

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

Date of the procedure for which a general anaesthetic is required:______/_______/________ 

 
Statement of parent (or person who has parental responsibility) 
 
Tick to confirm: 
 

I confirm that I have parental responsibility for this child. 

 
 

I have read the ‘Consent for General Anaesthesia’ Leaflet / watched the ‘Consent for General 

           Anaesthesia’ Video (https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ud92WdcFKGA). 

I understand the information provided in the ‘Consent for General Anaesthesia’ Leaflet / 
Video. 
 

I have had the opportunity to ask questions about the risks, benefits, and alternatives to 
General Anaesthesia. 0151 252 5845. 
 

I give consent for General Anaesthesia. 
 
 
I understand that you cannot give me a guarantee that a particular anaesthetist will 
administer the general anaesthetic. The anaesthetist will, however, have appropriate 
experience. 
 
I understand that additional procedures, which may become necessary during the general 
anaesthetic, will only be carried out if it is necessary to save the life of my child or to prevent 
serious harm to his or her health. 
 

Signature:______________________________ Date:_______________________________ 
 
Name (PRINT): ______________________________________________________________ 
 
Relationship to child: ________________________________________________________ 
 
Anaesthetist confirmation of consent 

I have highlighted the following specific risks relevant to this patient and procedure: 

___________________________________________________________________________ 

I have confirmed with the child and his or her parent(s) that they have no further questions and wish to go 
ahead with the general anaesthetic. 

Signed: _________________________________   Date: __________________________________ 
 
Name (PRINT): ___________________________  Job title: ________________________________ 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ud92WdcFKGA
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Jackson Rees Department of Anaesthesia 

Consent for General Anaesthesia 

Information for parents and carers 

 
 

Introduction 

This leaflet aims to provide you with the information you need when deciding whether or not to 
give consent for General Anaesthesia. This information is also available as a video:  
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ud92WdcFKGA 
  
You need to sign the attached form confirming that you have received and understood the 
information in this leaflet. You need to bring the signed form with you on the day of the 
procedure for which the general anaesthetic is required. 

You have the right to change your mind at any time before the anaesthetist has started giving the 
anaesthetic to your child. That includes the right to change your mind after you have signed the form.  

Benefits of General Anaesthesia 

General Anaesthesia allows painful or uncomfortable operations and investigations to be performed 
in a safe and acceptable way. Under General Anaesthesia a child is unconscious and has no 
awareness of the procedure. Another important function of General Anaesthesia is pain relief.  

The anaesthetist will monitor your child’s condition throughout the anaesthetic. 

Alternatives to General Anaesthesia 

A few operations can be done awake, using local anaesthetic. The surgeon or physician 
performing the operation will be able to advise you if this is an option.  

For most operations or investigations done under general anaesthetic in children, the only 
alternative to general anaesthesia is not to have the operation or investigation.  

Common side-effects following General Anaesthesia 

• Feeling or being sick (vomiting) 

About 10 children out of 100 who have had a general anaesthetic will feel sick or vomit.1 
Medicines can be given to treat this. The risk is higher in older children. 

• Confusion and agitation on waking up 

About 10 children out of 100 who have had a general anaesthetic will be very restless and 
confused on waking up.2 They may cry and be difficult to comfort. This usually lasts for less 
than 10 minutes, but can last for several hours.2 

• Sore throat 

About 12 people out of 100 who have a general anaesthetic will have a sore throat that lasts 
more than 24 hours.3 

• Headache 

About 17 people out of every 100 who have had a general anaesthetic will have a headache.4 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ud92WdcFKGA
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• Dizziness 

About 18 people out of every 100 who have a general anaesthetic will feel dizzy after waking 
up.4 

• Pain 

Between five and ten people out of 100 who have had a general anaesthetic for surgery will 
have severe pain after the operation, despite medicines given to prevent this.5,6 If this is the 
case for your child, the nursing staff and anaesthetist will take steps to try and treat the pain.  

 
Risks and complications of General Anaesthesia 

The following information describes the rare but serious complications of general anaesthesia.  

Oxygen 

Problems encountered during an anaesthetic may result in low oxygen levels in the blood and this 
can lead to harm. 

Causes of low oxygen levels in the blood include:  

- Laryngospasm 

Laryngospasm is spasm of the vocal cords and muscles of the voice box (larynx) resulting in 
obstruction (blockage) of the airway making it difficult or impossible to get oxygen into the lungs. A 
large study of complications of anaesthesia in children reported 120 episodes of laryngospasm for 
every 10 000 anaesthetics.7 At Alder Hey Children’s Hospital we perform about 20 000 
anaesthetics every year. 

Most episodes of laryngospasm are successfully managed by the anaesthetist with no harm to the 
child. However, severe laryngospasm can lead to cardiac arrest. In cardiac arrest the heart is not 
pumping blood to the rest of the body.  

About 3 out of every 1000 episodes of laryngospasm results in the buildup of fluid in the airspaces 
of the lung.7 This is known as pulmonary oedema. This often gets better quickly, but may require 
support of breathing with a ventilator (breathing machine) on the intensive care unit. 

Coughs and colds due to viral infections make laryngospasm more likely. 

- Bronchospasm 

Bronchospasm is a tightening of the muscles lining the airways (bronchi) in the lungs. It is similar 
to an asthma attack, but can occur during an anaesthetic even in people who are not asthmatic. It 
makes it difficult for the lungs to work and may result in low oxygen levels in the blood.  

A large study of complications of anaesthesia in children reported 120 episodes of bronchospasm 
for every 10 000 anaesthetics.7 

Most episodes of bronchospasm can be managed with no harm to the child. However, about 5 out 
of every 1000 episodes of bronchospasm during an anaesthetic will be severe enough to require 
admission to the intensive care unit.7 

Coughs and colds due to viral infections will make bronchospasm more likely. 

- Aspiration of stomach contents 

Stomach juices (acid) and partially digested food from the stomach can come up the food-pipe 
(oesophagus) and go down the wind-pipe (trachea) into the lungs. This can injure the lungs and 
make it difficult to get enough oxygen into the blood. It can also lead to infection in the lungs 
(pneumonia). 
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A large study of complications of anaesthesia in children reported 9 cases of aspiration for every 
10 000 anaesthetics.7 Not all episodes of aspiration result in harm. A large national audit reported 
8 episodes of aspiration resulting in death, brain damage or intensive care admission per million 
anaesthetics.8  

Children are fasted (not allowed to eat or drink) before general anaesthesia to reduce the risk of 
aspiration. Please follow the advice you have been given.  

- Complications of airway management 

The airway refers to the passages that carry air to the lungs: the nose, mouth, throat (pharynx), 
voice box (larynx), windpipe (trachea), and the lower airways (bronchi). 

All general anaesthetics require airway management by the anaesthetist. The anaesthetist must 
ensure that the airway is not blocked and that the lungs are ventilated with gas containing at least 
21% oxygen. Exactly how this is done depends on the nature of the procedure for which the 
anaesthetic is required and certain characteristics of the person having the anaesthetic. It may 
involve placing a tube in the wind pipe and using a breathing machine (ventilator) to ventilate the 
lungs. 

Airway management may prove difficult. It may be difficult to overcome a blockage in the airway or 
adequately ventilate the lungs. It may be impossible to place a tube in the windpipe. These 
problems can result in low oxygen levels in the blood. In trying to manage a difficult airway the 
airway may be injured. 

When extreme difficulty is encountered it may be necessary to make a hole in the windpipe 
through the font of the neck in order to save a patient’s life. 

Complications of airway management may require admission to the intensive care unit. They may 
also result in death or brain damage. A national audit including patients of all ages estimated the 
risk of death due to complications of airway management to be about 6 deaths per million general 
anaesthetics.8 The risk of permanent brain damage due to complications of airway management is 
about 1 person per million general anaesthetics.8 

Heart Problems 

Problems with how the heart pumps blood around the body may occur during a general 
anaesthetic. These problems may result in an inadequate supply of blood, carrying oxygen and 
nutrients, to the organs of the body. This in turn may result in harm. 

Such problems may be caused by: 

- An abnormally slow heart beat (Bradycardia) 

A study of complications of anaesthesia in children estimated the risk as 28 cases of slow heart 
beat needing urgent treatment for every 10 000 anaesthetics.7 The anaesthetist will be monitoring 
your child’s heart rate and rhythm throughout the operation and has been trained to manage 
problems with heart rate and rhythm. 

- An abnormally fast or irregular heart beat 

The estimated risk is 44 cases of abnormal heart rhythm requiring urgent treatment for every  
10 000 anaesthetics.7 

- An abnormally low blood pressure 

The blood pressure is related to how much blood is pumped out by the heart every minute.  

There are many causes of low blood pressure during anaesthesia including bleeding, allergic 
reactions, and the side effects of anaesthetic medicines. The side effects of anaesthetic medicines 
are more pronounced in very sick children.  
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Blood pressure is expected to be lower during anaesthesia than when awake and a low blood 
pressure does not necessarily cause harm, however a very low blood pressure may be associated 
with inadequate blood supply to organs such as the brain, kidneys and even the heart itself. This 
may result in brain damage, kidney failure or cardiac arrest. 

The risk is 123 cases of low blood pressure during anaesthesia requiring urgent treatment for 
every 10 000 anaesthetics.7 

- Abnormally high blood pressure 

This is much less likely than low blood pressure, but may result from an underlying disease or a 
medication error. The risk is 2 cases of high blood pressure requiring urgent treatment for every 10 
000 anaesthetics.7 

Allergic reaction 

Allergic reactions can occur to medicines, latex (often used to make surgical gloves), or the 
solutions used to clean the skin before surgery. Allergic reactions can be life-threatening. The 
anaesthetist is trained to recognize and treat these reactions. The risk of a life-threatening allergic 
reaction during anaesthesia in children (called anaphylaxis) is estimated as 2 to 3 reactions per 
100 000 anaesthetics.9 

Malignant hyperthermia reaction 

Malignant hyperthermia is a rare genetic condition (it runs in families). When a person with 
malignant hyperthermia receives certain anaesthetic medicines their muscles over-heat. The 
muscle cells may be damaged. The result of the heat and muscle damage can be life-threatening. 
The anaesthetist is trained to recognize this and treat it.  For those who are known to have this 
condition it is possible to avoid the anaesthetic medicines that trigger the reaction. The risk is 1 
malignant hyperthermia reaction per 100 000 anaesthetics.10 

Awareness 

Awareness describes the situation where a patient who is intended to be unconscious under 
general anaesthesia is awake. The vast majority of anaesthetics do not require medicines that 
relax the muscles and make it impossible to move. Your child’s anaesthetist will also be monitoring 
how much anaesthetic medicine is being given. A large national audit of awareness during general 
anaesthesia found 1 to 2 reports of awareness in children per 100 000 anaesthetics.11 

An error in giving a medicine  

It is possible to make mistakes when giving medicines. The wrong medicine may be given, a 
necessary medicine may not be given, or the wrong dose may be given. Medicine may be given 
by the wrong route (for instance a medicine that should have been used as a local anaesthetic to 
numb a nerve could be given into a vein). The outcome of such an error can vary from no harm to 
life-threatening. The risk of such an error is 5 errors per 10 000 anaesthetics.12   

Some medicines are given in to the veins via a small plastic tube called a cannula. Cannulas can 
become misplaced such that the tip of the cannula is not within the vein but comes to lie in the 
flesh just outside the vein. Cannulas may be misplaced at the time they are put in, but they can 
also become misplaced having initially been correctly placed within the vein. If medicines or fluids 
are given through a misplaced cannula they can cause injury. Cannulas are also associated with a 
risk of infection, which may be either localized to where the cannula has been placed in the body, 
or a more generalized infection in the blood stream. There is a risk of inflammation of the vein 
where a cannula has been placed. This inflammation is not necessarily due to infection and may 
be due to medicines given via the cannula or simply the presence of the cannula.  Placing a 
cannula and attempts at placing a cannula may cause bruising. 
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Equipment failure 

It is possible for a piece of equipment to malfunction and fail. Essential equipment is checked on a 
daily basis before giving an anaesthetic. The risk of equipment failure is 13 incidents of equipment 
problems per 10 000 anaesthetics.13 

Eye injury 

Fewer tears are produced when people are anaesthetized and not everyone’s eyes are completely 
shut when they are anaesthetized. The sensitive lining at the front of the eyeball (cornea) can dry 
out and get injured. We take great care to protect the eyes and tape them shut. For some long 
procedures we also put a lubricating ointment in the eye. The risk of eye injury is 560 in a million.14 
The risk of loss of vision (partial or complete blindness), that is still present 30 days after an 
anaesthetic for an operation that did not involve the eyes or brain, is 8 in-a-million.15 

Damage to the teeth or dental work such as crowns or bridges 

Your anaesthetist will take great care to protect your child’s teeth. Nevertheless teeth and dental 
work can be damaged. Your child may need a plastic tube in the airway or wind-pipe to help with 
breathing when they are anaesthetized. Teeth can be damaged either as this tube is put in or 
taken out. It may be safest to remove very loose milk teeth when you child is anaesthetized. Your 
anaesthetist will ask about loose teeth and discuss this with you. The risk of damaging the teeth is 
1 in 10 000.13 

Injury to lips, tongue, voice box and windpipe 

Airway management may result in injury to the lips, tongue, voice box or windpipe. Stridor is noisy 
breathing caused by narrowing of the airway at the level of the voice box or windpipe. Swelling of 
the lining of the airway may cause narrowing and stridor. In children, the risk of stridor after an 
anaesthetic is 70 cases of stridor per 10 000 anaesthetics.7 For most children with post-
anaesthetic stridor it will settle over a period of hours. However, some children with post-
anaesthetic stridor require admission to the intensive care unit. 

Nerve injury 

Nerves may be injured by pressure or stretch. This is more likely when a patient is lying in one 
position for a very long time. Great care is taken to position your child to avoid these injuries.  In 
adult patients, the risk of this sort of injury, involving the ulnar nerve that runs behind the elbow, is 
47 injuries per 10 000 anaesthetics.16 The risk appears to be lower in children. 

Pressure sores 

Great care is taken when positioning anaesthetized children for surgery. Operating tables have 
specially designed mattresses to reduce the risk of pressure sores. The operating team also place 
padding in an effort to avoid injuries from pressure. However, it is often not possible to move an 
anaesthetized child once surgery has started and so there is a risk of pressure sores, especially 
with long procedures.  

Change in behaviour 

Behaviour may change after an anaesthetic. These changes in behaviour include withdrawal, 
apathy, general anxiety, separation anxiety (anxiety provoked by separation from the main carer) 
and regression (where a child shows behaviour that they have already grown out of). A study of 
negative behavioural change after anaesthesia found that 24 out of every 100 children who had 
had an anaesthetic, had significant negative behaviour change 3 days after the anaesthetic.17 
Sixteen out of every 100 children who had an anaesthetic had significant negative behaviour 
change at 30 days after the anaesthetic.17 However, it cannot be said that the anaesthetic causes 
the behaviour change. Children do not receive anaesthesia without hospitalization and some sort 
of procedure or surgery. 

 



 

7 

Death 

Very rarely a complication of general anaesthesia causes the death of a person. For every million 
anaesthetics, about ten people die directly as a result of an anaesthetic complication.18, 19, 20 
These numbers are averages for large groups of patients of all ages having an anaesthetic. 

There are many complications of general anaesthesia that can result in the death of a person.  

Recent studies have shown the commonest reasons are:  

• Aspiration - injury to the lungs caused by stomach acid coming up the food-pipe (oesophagus) 
and then going down the wind-pipe (trachea) and into the lungs,  

• Failure to get enough oxygen into the blood because of a blocked airway, and 

• Failure to breathe adequately because of the effect of medicines given to the person (often to 
relieve pain).18,19 

Cardiac Arrest  

Cardiac arrest means that the heart is not pumping blood to the body. It may be possible to treat 
this and get the heart pumping again. The risk is 3 cardiac arrests per 10 000 anaesthetics.7 

A study of anaesthesia related cardiac arrest in children found that 61% recovered without injury, 
5% suffered permanent harm, and 28% died.21 

Various complications may result in cardiac arrest in an anaesthetized child. The commonest are:  

• Bleeding,  

• Blockage of the airway caused by spasm of the vocal cords,  

• Very high levels of potassium in the blood after blood transfusion or certain anaesthetic 
medicines,  

• The direct effect of anaesthetic medicines on the heart.21 

Unplanned admission to the Paediatric Intensive Care Unit (PICU) 

Some complications of anaesthesia may require admission to PICU for further treatment. This may 
involve a patient being kept asleep and supporting their breathing with a breathing machine 
(ventilator). 

The risk of an unplanned admission to PICU following an anaesthetic complication is 4 PICU 
admissions per 10 000 anaesthetics.22 

Coma (failure to regain consciousness)  

This complication is the result of severe injury to the brain and is not due to the anaesthetic 
medicine itself. It may be the result of the brain not getting enough oxygen or glucose (blood-
sugar). The risk of persistent coma with failure to wake up at 24 hours after the anaesthetic is 50 
in-a million.18  

Summary 

Most children can be safely anaesthetized. However, complications do happen.  

Your child’s anaesthetist is highly trained to: 

• Deliver the safest possible anaesthetic  

• Avoid complications where this is possible   

• Detect and treat complications should they occur 
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Your child’s anaesthetist will also try to prevent or treat the side effects of anaesthesia and surgery 
such as vomiting and pain. 

Questions 

If you have any questions regarding the risks or benefits of general anaesthesia, please do ask. 
We are here to help you and your child. You can do so by contacting us on: 

0151 252 5845 (Anaesthetic Pre-Op Service). 

You will also have the opportunity to speak to your child’s anaesthetist and ask questions on the 
day of the operation or investigation. 
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This leaflet only gives general information.  You must always discuss the individual treatment of 
your child with the appropriate member of staff.  Do not rely on this leaflet alone for information 
about your child’s treatment. 

This information can be made available in other languages and formats if requested. 
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