Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI202223/674

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 31 March 2023

Subject: Outsourcing Scans to be performed

Q1 Please provide information for the following financial years, 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20,
2020/21, 2021/22, 2022/23, for the respective diagnostic imaging data:

a. Volumes of MRI, CT and PET CT scans, split by scan type performed

b. The volume MRI, CT and PET CT scans, split by scan type and which providers you
outsource the scans

c. Please provide outsourcing price per scan split by CT, MRl and PET CT

Al a. Please see attached document: FOI 674 Response
b. Please see attached document: FOI 674 Response
c. Unique pricing values have been exempted under Section 43 — Commercial Interests,

due to the potential damage to commercial interests of the current suppliers as release
of this information and any other unique pricing likely to be requested for disclosure
would allow other competitors a significant competitive advantage and thus harm the
commercial interests of our current suppliers.

Q2 Can you please provide details of all the current CT, MRI and PET CT outsourcing
contracts you currently have in place, can you please include the following data where
possible:

a. Scan modality

b. Contract length

c. Agreed pricing and volumes

d. KPI or performance metrics and any data on how they are performing
A2 CT

aoow

coow

1 Year (renewed annually)
Contract Value: £37,225
Information not held

MRI

1 Year (renewed annually)
Contract Value: £116,493.00
Information not held



Q1a: Volumes of CT, MRI and PET CT scans, split by scan type performed

2017/18 [2018/19 [2019/20 |2020/21 12021/22 12022/23
MRI 8830 8806 8250 7246 8491 8767
CT 2787 2924 2851 2290 3065 3233
PET CT Information not held - this is no activity as this service is

provided by Royal Preston Hospital

Q1b: The volume MRI, CT and PET CT scans, split by scan type and which providers you outsource the scans

2017/1812018/19(2019/20|2020/21]2021/22|2022/23
MRI 0 0 0 0 0 0
CT 0 0 0 0 0 0
PET CT - Outsourced to 5 0 0 0 0 0

Preston Hospital
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