Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI202223/666

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 30 March 2023

Subject: Contracts for facilities services including Cleaning, Catering. Portering,

Security and Other Facilities Management
Please can you provide me with the following information:

A full list of all contracts held for facilities services delivered by an external provider on behalf of
the Trust, including any services sub-contracted as part of PFl arrangements, relating to the
following areas:

1. Cleaning

2. Catering

3. Portering

4. Security

5. Other Facilities Management

For each, please provide the following information:

a. The name of the current provider for each contract;

b. The value of each contract;

c. The number of staff employed on each contract;

d. The expiry date for each contract, and the date that any decision would need to be made
regarding renewal;

e. Dates of any break clauses within the contracts, and/or details of whether each contract
carries an option to extend the duration of the contract;

f. A named contact for the responsible manager for that service.

Q1 Cleaning
Al a-f: Information not held — this service is not contracted out and is all managed in-house
Q2 Catering
A2 a-f: Information not held — this service is not contracted out and is all managed in-house
Q3 Portering
A3 a-f: Information not held — this service is not contracted out and is all managed in-house
Q4 Security

A4 Carlisle Security Services

£1,551,641.82
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Not applicable
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Q5 Other Facilities Management
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A5 a-f: not applicable



