Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI202223/664

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 29 March 2023

Subject: OFF-Framework agency usage and spend between 1st of January 2022 to

31st of December 2022

Q1 Who is responsible for managing the recruitment of temporary staff and what is their work
email address

Al NHS Professionals, alderhey@nhsprofessionals.nhs.uk

Q2 Could you please provide your total OFF-Framework agency spend between 1st of
January 2022 to 31st of December 2022 for:
a. Nurses (all bands and specialties)
b. General Practitioners (please answer separately)

A2 a. £26,257
b. Information not held - we do not provide General Practitioners.

Q3 Could you please list individually which specialty of nurses hired through off-framework
agencies that accumulated agency spend in excess of £100,000 between the 1st of
January 2022 to 31st of December 2022.

Example answers for question 3: Advance Nurse Practitioners total off framework agency
spend £101,000, Mental Health Nurses total off framework agency spend £202,596,
Paediatric Nurses total off framework agency spend £185,696.

A3 Information not held, as per A2 above
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