

Reference FOI202223/651

Number:

From: Private Individual

**Date:** 22 March 2023

**Subject:** Suppliers and contract information for various clinical systems e.g LIMS,

RIS, PACS

Q1 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:

- a. Who is your current LIMS (Laboratory information management system) provider?
  - i. What is the overall contract value?
  - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
- b. Who was the provider under the previous LIMS (Laboratory information management system) contract?
  - i. What was the tenure /length of the contract?
- c. When did you first implement a LIMS (Laboratory information management system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A1 a. Meditech
  - i. £650,000 ex VAT
  - ii. 5 years
  - b. Meditech
    - i. 5 years
  - c. 2013
- Q2 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current RIS (Radiology Information System) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous RIS (Radiology information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure /length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a RIS (Radiology information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A2 a. Wellbeing Software (WBS)
  - i. £321k
  - ii. 5 years
  - b. Wellbeing Software (WBS)
    - i. 10 years
  - c. 2013
- Q3 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current PACS (Picture archiving and communication system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?



**NHS Foundation Trust** 

- b. Who was the provider under the previous PACS (Picture information and communication system) contract?
  - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
- c. When did you first implement a PACS (Picture information and communication system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A3 a. Philips
  - i. £1.2M
  - ii. 10 years
  - b. Philips
    - i. 10 years
  - c. 2013
- Q4 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current OIS (Oncology information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous OIS (Oncology information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement an OIS (Oncology information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A4 a-c: Information not held no dedicated system in place
- Q5 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current MIS (Maternity information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous MIS (Maternity information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a MIS (Maternity information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A5 Information not held Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital does not have a maternity ward or any maternity related services.
- Q6 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current PIS (Pharmacy information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous PIS (Pharmacy information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a PIS (Pharmacy information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A6 a. CareFlow Medicines Management (CMM)
  - i. £32 273 ex VAT per annum
  - ii. 01/10/2022 to 30/09/2023 but can be extended each year up to 10 years



- b. Wellsky (now CMM)
  - i. 3 years
- c. Information not held
- Q7 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current NIS (Nurse information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous NIS (Nurse information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a NIS (Nurse information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A7 a. Meditech
  - a. £650,000 ex VAT
  - b. 5 years
  - b. Meditech
    - a. 5 years
  - c. 2013
- Q8 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current CIS (Clinical information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous CIS (Clinical information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a CIS (Clinical information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A8 a. Meditech
  - i. £650,000 ex VAT
  - ii. 5 years
  - b. Meditech
    - i. 5 years
  - c. 2013
- Q9 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current FIS (Financial information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous FIS (Financial information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a FIS (Financial information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- Q9 a. North East Patches (NEP)



- i. £574,854.00
- ii. 84 months
- b. Information not held we have always been with NEP
- c. Information not held we have always been with NEP
- Q10 For each hospital within your trust, please provide:
  - a. Who is your current BBIS (Blood bank information system) provider?
    - i. What is the overall contract value?
    - ii. What is the tenure / length of the contract?
  - b. Who was the provider under the previous BBIS (Blood bank information system) contract?
    - i. What was the tenure/length of the contract?
  - c. When did you first implement a BBIS (Blood bank information system) at each hospital within your trust?
- A10 a. Meditech
  - i. £650,000 ex VAT
  - ii. 5 years
  - b. Meditech
    - i. 5 years
  - c. 2013