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Number:  

FOI202223//603 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

21 February 2023 

Subject: 
 

Details of Theatre staff 

 
Q1 The name and email address of the person within your Trust that holds the following role 

/ responsibilities: 
 
a. Pre–Operative Manager 
b. Pre-Operative Director  
c. Pre-Operative Assessment Manager 
d. Head of Pre-Operative Assessment 
e. Head of Theatre Services 
f. Head of Surgery services 
g. Post Operative Manager 
h. Post Operative Director 
i. Head of Post Operative care / discharge 
j. Ward Manger of Post Operative  

  
A1 a. Richard Hayhurst, Richard.hayhurst@alderhey.nhs.uk 

b. Information not held – we do not have this role at our Trust 
c. Shelley Cobley , Shelley.Cobley@alderhey.nhs.uk 
d. Information not held – we do not have this role at our Trust 
e. This would fall under the remit of our Head of Nursing / Allied Health Professionals 

(AHP’s) for Theatre, Neil Herbert, Neil.Herbert@alderhey.nhs.uk 
f. This would fall under the remit of our Head of Nursing for Surgery Services, Kelly 

Black, Kelly.Black@alderhey.nhs.uk 
g. Information not held – we do not have this role at our Trust 
h. Information not held – we do not have this role at our Trust 
i. Information not held – we do not have this role at our Trust 
j. Information not held – we do not have this role at our Trust. We have multiple post 

operative areas within the Trust and no such singular role exists. 
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