Reference
Number:
From:
Date:
Subject:
Q1
a.
b.
C.
d.
e.
Al a.
b.
C.
d.
e.
Q2
a.
b.
C.
d.
e.
A2 a.
b.
(of
d.
e.
Q3
a.
b.
C.
d.
e.
f.
g.
h.
A3

Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust
FOI202223//601
Private Individual
20 February 2023

Details of the Trust's IT infrastructure

For each element of IT infrastructure below, please provide the requested details (Main
provider, annual spend 2021-2022, contract end date):

Desktop management
Networking

Data Centre

Server management
IT Security

Information not held — this is internally managed
Networking Intercity - £250,000 rolling contract next renewal is June 2023
Information not held — this is internally managed
Information not held — this is internally managed
Information not held — this is internally managed

For each of the elements below, please provide details about your cloud provider (name,
contract end date):

Data storage
Networking
Back-up and archive

Application databases

Big Data analytics databases

Information not held — we do not have a cloud provider for this
Information not held — we do not have a cloud provider for this
Rubrick. contract end date: November 2024

Information not held — we do not have a cloud provider for this
Information not held — we do not have a cloud provider for this

For each of the elements below, does your organisation plan to move to a cloud-based
service in the next 2 years?

apop

Data storage

Networking

Back-up and archive

Processing and computer capacity

Application databases
Analytics databases

Email and collaboration
Other (Please specify)

No

No

This is already a Cloud-based service
Yes



S o

Yes

Yes

This is already a Cloud-based service
Not applicable
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