
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202223/576 

From: 
 

Other 

Date: 
 

06 February 2023 

Subject: 
 

The number of patients diagnosed with genetic haemochromatosis 

 
Q1 For the period 1st January 2022 to 31st December 2022 (or the most recent 12 month 

period available), the number of patients diagnosed with genetic haemochromatosis 
under your care. 

  
A1 Information exempted under Section 40: Personal data. Providing this information would 

likely identify individuals involved. 
  
Q2 For the period 1st January 2022 to 31st December 2022 (or the most recent 12 month 

period available), the average time in days from first referral from primary care to the 
patient’s first appointment within your trust, for patients diagnosed with genetic 
haemochromatosis. 

  
A2 Information not held - no patients referred in the last year with haemochromatosis 
  
Q3 A copy of your protocol and/or patient pathway applicable to the care of people with 

genetic haemochromatosis. 
  
A3 Information not held – we do not have a protocol or patient pathway as this disease is 

rare 
  
Q4 The date that your protocol/patient pathway for genetic haemochromatosis was last 

reviewed or revised. 
  
A4 Information not held – as per A1 above 
  
Q5 A copy of your clinical protocol(s) for therapeutic venesection. 
  
A5 Please see attached document: Venesection v1.0 - Draft_Redacted 

 
Please note, the attached document is in draft form. 
 
Staff names exempted under Section 40: Personal Information. Although the information 
relates to their public role and accountability for managing budgets, disclosure of names 
of all individuals may potentially have adverse consequences to the employees. Any 
names of staff that are available in the public domain are accessible via our website 
https://alderhey.nhs.uk/ 

  
Q6 The date that your protocol(s) for therapeutic venesection were last reviewed or revised. 
  
A6 Please see attached document: Venesection v1.0 - Draft_Redacted 

 
Please note, the attached document is in draft form. 
 

https://alderhey.nhs.uk/


 
Staff names exempted under Section 40: Personal Information. Although the information 
relates to their public role and accountability for managing budgets, disclosure of names 
of all individuals may potentially have adverse consequences to the employees. Any 
names of staff that are available in the public domain are accessible via our website 
https://alderhey.nhs.uk/ 

  
The Trust is unable to respond to all or specific elements of your request where the response 
would indicate five or less individuals. The Trust is withholding this information under Section 40 
(Personal Information) of the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) 2000 to reduce the risk of any 
individuals being identified. The Trust is of the view that disclosure of such information would 
significantly increase the risk of individuals being identified and as such would constitute a 
breach of their personal data. 
 
The Trust has applied exemption Section 40(2) of the FOIA and is therefore withholding the 
information as disclosure which may identify an individual would breach their rights under the 
Data Protection Act 2018. The grounds for application of this exemption include: 

• Any data relating to patients or staff is third party data, furthermore health data is 
classified as sensitive personal data within the Data Protection Act 2018. As such, 
Section 40 (2) of the FOIA applies along with the Trusts duty of confidentiality. Therefore 
under s.2 (3) (f) (ii) of the FOIA, there is an absolute exemption from disclosure on the 
grounds that it would contravene the First Data Protection Principle. 

 

• The Trust has a duty under the Data Protection Act 2018 and specifically the First Data 
Protection Principle to ensure personal data regarding staff and patients is processed 
fairly and lawfully. Disclosure of such data which may identify an individual, either through 
the data alone or other data in conjunction with that data which may identify an individual 
would therefore breach this principle. 

 
The Data Protection Act 2018 defines sensitive personal data to include data relating to the 
“physical or mental health or condition” of a person. Any such information about specific 
individuals falls within this category and disclosure of such data including statistical data, with 
any potential likelihood of identification would breach the Data Protection Act 2018. 

 

https://alderhey.nhs.uk/
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2. Quick Reference Guide –  Venesection for iron overload in paediatric 
haematology patients 

 
 

 
  

Clinical Assessment of patient 
by nurse performing procedure  

Review of previous blood results 
 
Have any parameters reached their target? 
 
Is the last Hb below reference range for age? 
 
Have the last 3 Hb levels been falling rapidly? 

Yes 

Diagnosis of iron overload made by 
Consultant Haematologist 

Following is documented on patients electronic 
record: 
Frequency of venesection 
Volume to be venesected 
Target Hb/ferritin/transferrin saturation 
Discussion with child and carers about venesection  

No 

PAUSE 
 
Seek clinical advice before 
proceeding  
 
Consider waiting for results 
of FBC prior to starting 
procedure or reviewing 
target levels on an individual 
basis 
 

GO AHEAD 
 
Proceed with venesection 
as per guidelines below 
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3. Introduction 
 
3.1  Iron overload can lead to multiple organ dysfunction/failure and poor quality of 

life in a variety of patients with different haematological conditions, including 
haemoglobinopathies, polycythaemias, haemochromatosis and post 
haematopoietic stem cell transplant. Patients entering into haematopoietic stem 
cell transplantation with iron overload have an increased risk of delayed 
engraftment, veno-occlusive disease (VOD), infection and GVHD.  
In addition to oral or parenteral iron chelation, venesections may also be used 
as a treatment modality for the management of iron overload in selected 
patients. This SOP aims to define indications and contra-indications for the use 
of venesections in this clinical scenario, the competencies and equipment 
required, and to describe the procedures to be followed. 

 
4. Definitions 
 

VOD – veno-occlusive disease 
GVHD – graft versus host disease 
FBC – full blood count 
LFT – liver function test 
Hb – Haemoglobin 
Hct - Haematocrit 

 
5. Authorised Personal/Staff Competencies 
 

Daycare medical staff and/or senior nurse 
Venepuncture/Cannulation skills 
Clinical assessment skills 
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6. Diagnosis of Iron Overload and its clinical significance 
 
6.1 Whatever the aetiology, the diagnosis of iron overload and estimation of its 

clinical impact (ie: iron content in tissues, organ dysfunction) should include at 
least the following: 

• FBC, blood film  

• Ferritin, serum iron, transferrin, transferrin saturation,  

• Renal and liver function 
 

The following tests may be indicated in selected patients: 

• Hepatitis B/C serology if evidence of liver dysfunction or liver iron 
loading 

• Endocrine assessment if evidence of endocrine dysfunction. This may 
include Thyroid Function Testing, Growth Hormone Testing  

• HFE genotype status if family history of or suspicious of Hereditary 
Haemochromatosis – see guidelines from BSG and BSH for reference 
“Diagnosis and therapy of genetic haemochromatosis (review and 2017 
update) (bsg.org.uk)” 

• Ferriscan/T2* of the heart/liver for estimation of iron content 
 
6.2 Indications for treatment 

Consider intervention/treatment for the following patients: 

• Serum ferritin > 1000 microg/L 

• Transferrin Saturation > 50% 

• Estimated liver iron > 5 mg/g dry weight by MRI 

• Cardiac T2* MRI < 20 msec 

• Any sign of iron-related dysfunction of target organs (liver, heart, 
hypophysis, thyroid, pancreas). In these cases, biopsy of the relevant 
organ to correlate dysfunction with iron overload may be necessary 

6.3   Patients can be offered venesection if:  

• They have documented iron overload needing treatment, as above  

• Hb is within normal limits  

• Cardiovascularly stable with no contraindication to venesection 

• Borderline Hb levels are not an absolute contraindication if 
venesections are needed and still thought to be the most clinically 
appropriate treatment modality for controlling the iron overload.  
Essential to discuss with haematology team, consideration should be 
given to the concurrent use of erythropoietin to support Hb 

• (Verbal) patient/parent consent to procedure available 
 
7. Venesection Procedure 
 

Venesection involves the removal of a specified amount of blood by 
venepuncture to control iron overload. Frequency as well as ferritin or liver iron 
targets will be directed by the haematology team, but venesection will typically 
occur every 3 to 4 weeks if tolerated.    It should only be performed in the 
afternoon, after lunch in a well hydrated patient.   
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The procedure should only be undertaken by qualified members of staff who 
have been assessed and are competent in venepuncture and cannulation skills. 

 
• A clearly documented plan from the child’s consultant should be on 

patients electronic record 
• Prior to each venesection procedure the following should be done, as    

a baseline: 
o Weight, baseline temperature, pulse, respirations and blood    

pressure. 
o  Make a brief clinical assessment of the patient including any 

new or change to medical conditions, Ensure patient is well 
clinically and that there are no active clinical issues of concern. 

o Send FBC, U&Es, LFT’s, ferritin, iron studies (to include 
transferrin and transferrin saturation). 

• Ensure that the patient is fully informed of the procedure and any 
questions are answered. 

• If there is a history of fainting at time of venepuncture - lie flat for 
procedure and 30 minutes after completion. 

• The nurse must always ensure that the patient is feeling well and that 
he/she has eaten as hunger/dehydration can lead to fainting during or 
post procedure. 

• The patient’s previous Hb/ferritin/iron study results must be checked 
and reviewed prior to carrying out procedure to ensure they are not 
anaemic/becoming anaemic or have reached target values.  If there is 
concern regarding anaemia then await FBC on day of procedure 
before proceeding. 

• The amount of blood to be venesected must be calculated and 
documented prior to each venesection based on the patient's weight 
(5-7mls/kg to max 350mls). Some patients only tolerate a lower 
venesection amount so this can be lower if clinically appropriate. 

• Patient is cannulated and venesected over 30 mins or slower. 
• First blood specimen removed is used for laboratory tests. 
• Patient should be allowed to sit up after procedure and have a sugary 

drink (parents are asked to bring a sweet drink at each visit). If 
required 5-10ml/kg of normal saline can be administered. 

• After 15-30 minutes patient may be discharged if well. 
• Precautions explained to child/parent prior to each discharge: 

o Keep activity to a minimum on same day (e.g. no active sports) 
especially if returning to school 

o If feeling faint (cold, clammy) within few hours after venesection: 
  sit down and put head between knees or lie flat 

  have a sweet drink if possible 
  stay sitting/lying until feeling better 
  slowly get back onto feet 

• Inform CNS of fainting episode or unwell after discharge. 
• Amount of blood venesected, any complications, patient tolerance 

should be documented on the patient’s medical record.  
 














	576 Disclosure Log
	Venesection v1.0 - Draft_Redacted



