

Reference FOI202122512

Number:

From: Press/Media

Date: 04 March 2022

Subject: CAMHS in patient beds and temporary nursing staff

Past

Q1 How many beds on CAMHS inpatient wards were provided by your Trust on 1 March in each of the following years?

- a. 2017
- b. 2018
- c. 2019
- d. 2020
- e. 2021
- A1 a. 7
 - b. 7
 - c. 7
 - d. 7
 - e. 9
- Q2 What was the total amount spent on agency nurses in each of the following years, in relation to CAMHS inpatient services?
 - a. 2017
 - b. 2018
 - c. 2019
 - d. 2020
 - e. 2021
- A2 a. Information not held for this year
 - b. £19,252.24
 - c. £53,136.94
 - d. £67,520.60
 - e. £188,895.09
 - f. £168,382.84
- What was the total amount spent on bank nurses in each of the following years, in relation to CAMHS inpatient services? (Please understand 'bank nurses' to be nurses employed via NHS nursing banks)
 - a. 2017
 - b. 2018
 - c. 2019
 - d. 2020
 - e. 2021
- A3 a. Information not held for this year
 - b. £165,571.32
 - c. £202,325.78
 - d. £250,613.88



- e. £318,536.6
- f. £488,686.65
- How many full-time equivalent unregistered/support worker staff were you employing in relation to CAMHS inpatient services on 1 March in the following years:
 - a. 2018
 - b. 2019
 - c. 2020
 - d. 2021
 - e. 2022

	Δ	/	ı
1	_		r

	A: 2018	B: 2019	C: 2020	D: 2021	E: 2022
CAMHS Non- Registered Staff - FTE	104.27	117.11	135.36	176.95	202.38

- Q5 On how many shifts were bank and agency nurses (combined) used on CAMHS inpatient wards in the following years?
 - a. 2019
 - b. 2020
 - c. 2021
- **A5**
- a. 380
- b. 636
- c. 1066

e table from response letter