
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202122488 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

16 February 2022 

Subject: 
 

Number of patients diagnosed with prostate cancer and those who had 
Brachytherapy and cost of undergoing Brachytherapy 

 
 
Q1 I'd like to request data of the following for the last 5 years 2017, 2018, 2019, 2020 and 

2021, however if this exceeds the FOI time limit please provide the data for 2021 only: 
 

a. How many people were diagnosed with prostate cancer within your trust 
b. How many people that were diagnosed with prostate cancer had Brachytherapy  
c. The average cost of undergoing Brachytherapy 

  
A1 a. 2017 – Zero 

2018 – Zero 
2019 – Zero 
2020 – One 
2021 - Zero 

b. Information not held – Alder Hey Children’s hospital do not provide Brachytherapy 
c. Information not held  - Alder Hey Children’s hospital do not provide 

Brachytherapy 

 


