

**Reference** FOI202223/487

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 22 December 2022

**Subject:** Software used for cleanliness and estates audits, High Impact Interventions

and Surgical site surveillance

Q1 What software does your Trust use for:

- a. Cleanliness audits
- b. Estates audits
- c. High Impact Interventions
- d. Surgical Site surveillance
- A1 a. Information not held we currently don't use any software as the auditing is done on paper.
  - b. MICAD
  - c. Information not held we don't use any software for this
  - d. We use an inhouse built system.
- Q2 How much was invested in the software?
- A2 a. Information not held as per A1a above
  - b. £45k plus VAT
  - c. Information not held as per A1c above
  - d. Information not held as per A1d above