

Reference FOI202223/435

Number: From:

Press/Media

Date: 24 November 2022

Subject: Suppliers and contract end dates for various software

- Q1 Please state the suppliers and name of software used for the following systems used by the trust (if applicable):
 - a. Bed management system
 - b. Clinical decision support system
 - c. Hospital pharmacy system
 - d. Population health management system
 - e. Hospital discharge system
 - f. Theatre scheduling system
 - g. Clinical communications system
 - h. Remote consultation system provider (e.g. video and online consultations)
 - i. Advice and guidance system provider
 - j. Virtual ward and remote monitoring system provider
- A1 a. This is a module in the Electronic Patient Record (EPR) Meditech EPR provided by Meditech
 - b. This is a module in the EPR Meditech EPR provided by Meditech
 - c. Wellsky JAC
 - d. Information not held we do not have this system is use
 - e. This is a module in the EPR Meditech EPR provided by Meditech
 - f. This is a module in the EPR Meditech EPR provided by Meditech
 - g. Information not held we do not have this system is use
 - h. Attend Anywhere
 - i. Information not held we do not have this system is use
 - j. This is a module in the EPR Meditech EPR provided by Meditech
- Q2 Please state the expiry date for the trust's contracts with the suppliers referred to above for the systems in question.

A2 Attend Anywhere: August 2024

Meditech: July 2025

Wellsky: rolling yearly contract