

Reference FOI202122421

From: Press/Media

Number:

Date: 31 December 2021

Subject: Vaccine Wastage Figures

- Q1

 a. Between 8 December 2020 and 31 December 2021, how many doses of the Pfizer Covid vaccine were administered at each of your vaccination centres/hospital sites?
 - b. Between 8 December 2020 and 31 December 2021, how many doses of the Pfizer Covid vaccine were destroyed/discarded/thrown away at each of your vaccination centres/hospital sites?
 - c. Do you have a weekly/monthly breakdown of these figures? If so, can I be sent these please?
- A1 a. 2126

Q3

- b. Nine
- c. Information not held
- Q2 a. Between 4 January 2021 and 31 December 2021, how many doses of the AstraZeneca Covid vaccine were administered at each of your vaccination centres/hospital sites?
 - b. Between 4 January 2021 and 31 December 2021, how many doses of the AstraZeneca Covid vaccine were destroyed/discarded/thrown away at each of your vaccination centres/hospital sites?
 - c. Do you have a weekly/monthly breakdown of these figures? If so, can I be sent these please?
- A2 Information not held AstraZeneca Covid vaccines were not used by Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust
 - a. Between 7 April 2021 and 31 December 2021, how many doses of the Moderna Covid vaccine were administered at each of your vaccination centres/hospital sites?
 - b. Between 7 April 2021 and 31 December 2021, how many doses of the Moderna Covid vaccine were destroyed/discarded/thrown away at each of your vaccination centres/hospital sites?
 - c. Do you have a weekly/monthly breakdown of these figures? If so, can I be sent these please?
- A3 Information not held Moderna Covid vaccines were not used by Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust
- Q4 In those instances where doses of the Pfizer/AstraZeneca/Moderna vaccines were destroyed/discarded/thrown away, what reasons were given for staff not being able to administer them to patients?
- A4 A vial containing six doses was discarded due to contamination. Three were discarded at the end of the session due to missed appointments.

