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Contact details for Senior IT staff 

 
Q1 Could you please provide me with up to date names, job titles and email addresses for 

your Senior IT staff, such as;  
a. Chief Information Officer  
b. Chief Digital Officer  
c. Chief Technology Officer  
d. Head of Digital Transformation  
e. Director of IT / ICT / IM&T / Digital / Information / Technology  
f. Head of IT / ICT / IM&T / Digital / Information / Technology  
g. IT / ICT / IM&T / Digital / Information / Technology Manager  
h. Chief / Deputy Operating Officer  
i. Head / Director of Cyber Security  
j. ICT Project Manager  
k. ICT Programme Manager  
l. Network Manager / Head / Director  
m. ICT Infrastructure  
n. ICT Business Manager  
o. Head of IT Procurement  
p. ICT Officer  
q. ICT Network Officer 

  
A1 a. "This role falls under the remit of our Chief Digital and Information Officer. 

 
Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   

 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our ‘About Us’ 
section: https://alderhey.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board 
 

b. "This role falls under the remit of our Chief Digital and Information Officer. 

Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   

 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our ‘About Us’ 
section: https://alderhey.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board 
 

c. Jaswant Sagoo, Jaswant.sagoo@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
d. Leila Brown Leila.Brown@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
e. "This role falls under the remit of our Chief Digital and Information Officer. 

 
Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

https://alderhey.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board
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mailto:Leila.Brown@alderhey.nhs.uk


 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   

 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our ‘About Us’ 
section: https://alderhey.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board 
 

f. This role falls under the remit of our Head of Operational IT - Joe McIntyre, 

Joe.Mcintyre@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
g. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
h. "Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   

 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our ‘About Us’ 
section: https://alderhey.nhs.uk/about-us/our-board 
 

i. Paul Grimes, Paul.Grimes@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
j. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
k. Sarah Gibb, Sarah.Gibb@lhch.nhs.uk 

 
l. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
m. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
n. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
o. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
p. Information not held - we do not have this job role 

 
q. Information not held - we do not have this job role 
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