

Reference Number: FOI202223/353
From: Other
Date: 13 October 2022
Subject: Gender split consultant anaesthetists

Q1 How many male substantive consultant anaesthetists employed in your organisation?

A1 17

Q2 How many female substantive consultant anaesthetists employed in your organisation?

A2 19

Q3 Do you have a 'Lead Consultant/Clinical Lead for Regional Anaesthesia'?
a. What is their gender?

A3 Information not held - This is not applicable to Alder Hey

Q4 Do you have a 'Lead Consultant/Clinical Lead for Obstetric Anaesthesia'?
a. What is their gender?

A4 Information is not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist children's hospital does not have a maternity ward or any maternity related services.

Q5 Do you have a 'Departmental Lead for Anaesthesia' or equivalent role?
a. What is their gender?

A5 Yes
a. Male