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Number:  

FOI202122315 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

22 October 2021 

Subject: 
 

Contact details for service managers (business/operations) 

 
Q1 I was hoping you could help me with the names and contact information of the following 

people:  
1. A&E Service/Business/Operations Manager  
2. Acute Medicine Service/Business/Operations Manager  
3. Elderly/Stroke Service/Business/Operations Manager  
4. Pathology Service/Business/Operations Manager  
5. Paediatrics Service/Business/Operations Manager  
6. Radiology Service/Business/Operations Manager  
7. Gastro Service/Business/Operations Manager 

  
A1 1. Hannah Rogers, Hannah.Rogers@alderhey.nhs.uk  

2. Lauren Cummings, Lauren.Cummings@alderhey.nhs.uk    
3. Information not held - Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist 

children’s hospital and does not provide Elderly/Stroke Service 
4. Lauren Cummings, Lauren.Cummings@alderhey.nhs.uk 
5. Christine Hill, Christine.Hill@alderhey.nhs.uk   
6. Emma-Jayne Punter, Emma-Jayne.Punter@alderhey.nhs.uk  
7. Information not held – currently vacant 

  
Q2 Could you also please let us know how many Consultant Locums are in place currently 

within the Trust in each of the above specialties? 
  
A2 1. Information held however exempted under Section 40: Personal data, due to low 

number that could if released identify individuals 
2. Zero  
3. Zero  
4. Zero  
5. Paediatrics – 23 
6. Information held however exempted under Section 40: Personal data, due to low 

number that could if released identify individuals 
7. Information held however exempted under Section 40: Personal data, due to low 

number that could if released identify individuals 
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