
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202223/209 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

01 August 2022 

Subject: 
 

Staff Contacts for Transformation, Digital Transformation and PIFU 
programmes as of July 2022 

 
 
Q1 The staff name, phone number and email for the following job titles (or closest to) and for 

whoever has responsibility on managing Transformation, Digital Transformation and PIFU 
programmes as of July 2022: 
a. Director of Transformation 
b. Deputy Director of Transformation 
c. Director of Strategy and Transformation 
d. Head of Transformation 
e. Transformation Manager 
f. Head Of Digital Transformation 
g. Transformation Programme Manager 

  
A1 a. Information not held - this post doesn’t exist in the Trust 

 
b. This post doesn’t exist in Trust. However, responsibilities fall within the remit of the 

Trust’s Associate Director of Transformation – Natalie Palin, 0151 228 4811, 
Natalie.Palin@alderhey.nhs.uk 
  

c. This post doesn’t exist in Trust. However, responsibilities fall within the remit of the 
Trust’s Director of Strategy and Partnerships – Dani Jones, 0151 228 4811, 
Dani.Jones@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
d. Information not held - this post doesn’t exist in the Trust 
 
e. Information not held - this post doesn’t exist in the Trust 
 
f. This post doesn’t exist in the Trust. However, responsibilities fall within the remit of the 

Trust’s Chief Digital and Information Officer – Kate Warriner, 0151 228 4811, 
Kate.Warriner@alderhey.nhs.uk 

 
g. Information not held - this post doesn’t exist in the Trust 
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