Alder Hey Children’s NHS

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI202223/109

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 10 June 2022

Subject: Number of shifts worked by temporary/locum/bank staff and cost of

temporary/locum/bank staff

Please would you provide me with the following information concerning the use of temporary,
locum or bank staff for the duties performed by Junior Doctors.

Q1 The number of shifts worked by temporary/locum/bank staff.
a. For each of the years 2017, 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021.
b. For each hospital in the Trust
c. By Specialty.
d. For each staff grade.
Al Information not held — The Trust does not use a medical staff bank
Q2 The cost of this temporary/locum/bank staff
a. For each of the years 2017, 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021.
b. For each hospital in the Trust
c. By Specialty.
d. For each staff grade.

A2 Information not held — as per Al



